T Ho o TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazetie of India

EXTRAORDINARY
9T [I—EUS 3—3U-WUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & WehrioTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 47] ¢ faoett, Ig@faar, S=awt 25, 2018419 5, 1939
No. 47] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JANUARY 25, 2018/MAGHA 5, 1939

IE KD
(Trerem )

e
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

. 1/2018- ¥=HT 7 (V)

qr.#1.fA. 64(31).— FT a7 v HATHRT Afafiaw, 2017 (2017 #7 12) Fi am=r 9 FF 37 ey (1), T 11 H
3T YT (1), &7 15 FF 3T 9T (5) T 917 16 FF 3T 91T (1) F qTEq Taed ARRAT FHT JAT FId gU, Fvg qLHT,
afvog £ FReTfel % e I a97 39 979 § G gid gU % AT FAT SAfed # saedT g, TAgT, 9 9vh,
foreq s (Trore o) i srfarg=mT wear 11/2017-Fw=1 w2 (3%), fmiw 28 57, 2017, [ araf. 690 (1),
XA 28 S, 2017 F qEq AT & TSI, FATLTI & 9 11, T 3, IT-@E (i) | THIAT 3677 737 o7, | i< ey off
feferfera e wedt 8, Fom-

T ATEAT §, Gt F -
(F) FY TE&AT 3 F 90, wey (3) H, -
. 9% (iv) H,-

@) IT 9T () F w1 9 Aemterfaa @ wioeertoa B sro, 7em-

“(m) =eft 3 forw srame (org) frem/seam= w=ft stramer T (9dt) F siasta o T U g9 & w7
H TIRT Fd U AAH A FEqdl 1 T T AT (A G0,

(ii) IT 0T () F oAt Ao 3v wal #r sfa et B S, 769m-
“(aF) #rE fAmior se=mT 37 o= #ré gt fAwtor e S 5 a9y 3 o srare (orgdh) frem/mar w=ft
ATETH ATSTAT (TgLT) F A Toq/FH TeF/EATa Irfarameor/argdt faawre arfareeor & gy anfiar
 TEd TS 2TSTeT & qad AT &7 & FHSL 91 % fory (AT ararat & gataq 2,

527Gl1/2018 D



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(iii)

(Fr@) FE TRATr AT AT w77 e g Auior wrd S G q4dt F orw e (ogd)) Mem/ga w5t
ATETH TTSET () o STqd ATTHF & F FASL a1 (SSeq )/ o a1/ (TAAESIT)/HETH AT
-1 (THATSSH-1)/FeTH T a0-2 (THATES-2) | gaferg wiee fofw afeadt w=hm & smavta i ar
gferrea el & Fafea gr;

3T AT (F) F qeATq AFAfered 3T /&l & efq:eamiua fHam S, 7m;-

“(=) ET waq S & vE G e F wrfaes § g1 A s afafaaw, 1961 (1961 &7 43) &
AT USfiad I, TSIt T3 e IaTe, ST LT, 9 ST &7 7 0T TTEHeon & g
TSI HeATE TS AT F FAd HeATET TS Al T&TH F, Feg1q & F JATE FLA AT IEAHT

oo e % wrd § T Srar a7,
9. T (v) ¥,
@) IT UL (F) T “TISFT e F T T “THT” 9T FT Traeumioq & sruam,

(ii) IT W4T () F oAt Aeferfad 3v 7 t #r staerfua B s,
“(or) Forelt TRTEaer R TR F sand ST U HEd g et wrde Ui 60 & Wiew

gfd w3 e awa awww, fOqa d@emes, anfds amer & e 6 srfeEeT, w5
©.13/6/2009-3uAU, fawis 30 AT+, 2017 F dgd ATEHAAT T &1 (<47 4T 81,7

T e (ix) 3T S99 Hafea TateAt, Fay (3), (4) 3% (5) #, F v u¥ Feterfaa w1 wiawarfua

STTUSTT, 74T:-
(3) (4) (5)

“(ix) FeiT AT U FATRT AfAaftaaw, 2017 #i

g1 2 F SYaTEd (119) # Femwivarfag et Ford T STt UHT Faro Rt T e

aqEy g oI, S G ST ShEw ST T ST T g, el Il 3 (A g

TTT AT A A A TS 2 S £ 3w (i) AT 6 aﬁw%m%waﬁmﬁﬂ%@tﬁ

vi) ¥ PR da @ e & SO Feg I, TS 99T, 9 S 9

TTHTT, T ST AT CRE T TR AT AT 7 sTfereor, St off fafa & % g

LA TteaReor a7 Rt gt AT & yare T T T

FAT 2l |

(x)ﬁwwwﬁwaﬁﬁww,mﬂﬁ O N P &

g 2 F et (119) # e fAwfer .

. . TaT9 FT ST =T 2l, qgT 3! 3F T gy
Fgey TR I, o R e s ST 3 BT A A e T A
FIT q&T SehaTe 1 &1 T2 21 ST T3 e (vii) o 25 % SRt e TCRTL, TS 9T, 1§ ST e
faffdse qars #r Feg R, T5T A, G99 a1 T iR, S o Rafy @ ¥ g
BRI o G P e e R A o T 2 |
e 7 FoRet Ty e &t yaTe F:2ar ar
(xi) =¥ T T@AT F T F <7 AT ATAT AATT S
& wafdw, @wdfdn s % soeife fr Ford i wTer wF Faredt T i e S Ay
STTRET % WIEAH & UHT HATAl 7 T FA a1 | 05 | Hiee A AT T AT |
=afF F fory Fehig e ud e afafam [T TSR ST (jv) 3]

GTT 22 T 3T &7 (1) F i o 1T a9TH
T

(xii) Frrtor 2 < B 3 (i), (i), (i), (iv), o
(v), (vi), (vii), (viii),(ix), (x) 37 (xi) & fo &F |




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 3

(@) FH HEAT 9 % W, Hiaw (3) fi qA® #, 7y (v) H “WrHaw T97 oOsai F T UL “WTHAH T, FoAl
Terferay, Hiex Rafe (R amm T2rer & 918 & STE1 ST 8), 218 #fite S9er a1 Ui gars v gat
T giaeaTioa Frar s |

) w9 TGeaT 10 F q9e, Fiad (3) T A= (i) F T 9% 997w (3), (4) ¥ (5) H IHH "atdq qfafPat F w7
77 A ferfaa =1 sfaeenfug G SToe, 7em:-

(3) (4) (5)
“(ii) ATl *T AT T AT TAATAT FT Ford T AT (STeT, Steram, e s
ZTEH AT 05 Shom & R o ara §, 7 yuw) W
' qTa e & it Hwiee T ot 2 @
[T TR €T (iv) 3]

(iii) ofEgs argat & AT ATAF T TAAT
e =rere & o uw 39 A FaT, SugE (i) | 9
< (i) & vt |

(F)  #W e 16 ST 399 gated wfafeat & o 7w Featorfad i wfaerrta B s, om-

(1) ) 3) 4) | (5

“16 | ofit 9972 | (i) % 1 g 9% AU ST F WIeAw | Fex TLHIY, ST T,
HE TS AT EATAT FTOEFOT 5 1T TRl aardt grfeewor a1 | A
oY Tt e o <% ST ATt =T |

(il) T AT IT TZ F e 9 AT {0 A1 Gfw F et fe
#T g stet o oY oI w1 (i); 79 (iv) F 3T 9% (W), 3T 6%
(1), 3T W (F), 3T HT (TH) ¥ 3T W (TW@); U (V) F IT AT

(@), 3T AT (), 3T AL () ¥ IT 7L () T 9% (vi) F 3T AL
() # w7 "5eAaT 3 F g9 qar® F wiag (3) ¥ AAEe wer
arfe o fAmior it wgera argfd 1 s ffer g LA

Ford o = wiaf® & AfRa g fF ara o8 o3 a7 3u-ug 9¥
AT 39 et Tf9r 2 0] 98T R S 3 Sa wEd gl aw
TR For T F UF fAgrs T Afaw 21 | o7 uieqw & g #
‘el TI” HT ATHITT FLT G ST THE oIy =9 A== *

w2 H femr A B
(iii) ST (i) AT (ii) T 7IF HUe U qAT 9
(=) FH HEAT 17 & 99T Hioy "5t (3) ¥ 7 (vii) F T U2 9T wiq (3), (4) 37 (5) H & T S9S "atad

gfafeat & v wx feterfa w5 afeeerfa BT s, a9 -

(3) (4) (5)
“(vil) AT FT TRERT T AT TATTHT Ford fF vH @i (A1 R SE,
T 2T2H ATET SreraT, o aew FRET o6
25 ff o & F T AT A qUw)
AT I KT R(SE q AT TE BT
[T TSR HEAT (iv) 3E]




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

()

(1)

()

(viil) TZT AT BRTT Y Fard =T ey | Feed wOA T

afza &t a1 7=, o B s (), (i), =T S 3 =

(if), (iv), (v), (vi) T (vii) & 715 2 | : W@sz m;

gaor oft oA g,
AT arfd T
Bl

FH TEAT 23 % qHeT o 1 H, e (3) f vt (i) 7 Gatda wrew (5) i wiafe §, “Fareit £ arqfd, orsat &
TIAT “, T WAT o =TT (S T et o 22 aravew 3 <ft € 22 sravew Ja) § e S4Aneh & e

wiee § fore” 1 eiqeafog B s |

F TEAT 23 F qHT i’ (3) F T (i) F TIATT UL TIAT ST AT HwAHA (3), (4) ;2 (5) F wfafteat F v

7 fAaferfaa =1 sfaenfg G SToe, 7em-

(3) (4) (5)
“(i) ST T TEATT F =T H A AT A AT Ay wnh, F9r o AT UF AATA
FTAFT St o Tt FT ArTEy 3 Ao & e fere AT T S A
FT T FA AT FIRF F T Fefr wrer v A A Ay | 25 | Ao AT T
oTeT 22 ¥ I 9TRT (1) 3 ST TS AT AE E | [T FqCET e
(iv) 7]
(if) FerFr FT ST P SR (i) S (i) & Fore 2 9

FY TEAT 24 F e HiH (3),-

() F 7= (i) F wfafe 7 w7 srcdiam §, I () # ST ITATH (F) F T9Aq AEtred SuaraT i

sFqeaTiua AT STTusm, Tem-

“(ST) FT ITUTET 7 ZTSHT H A o ATLTH <7 ST ATt TaT,”;

(i) % 9= (i) F =9 U AT I99 GAAT wAT (3), (4) ;WT (5) Fr w@EAT F ra w FAetotaa wr

gieesTia foraT strosm, Tu-

®) “4) | (5
“(ii) == ISTTTIH /AT ITHFAH TH F A7T0T, AT AT ST 6T FqaT 6
(iii)) =T, FErega, 9 Si S wteraor it g 99T S 7 3ugEd (i) 7 fae g 9

FH TEAT 25 ¥ I HATAT A t9gT F v ¥ fAeterterd v yiaearfoa & sosm, 7=7m:-

(1) ) )

(4)

()

“o5 | ofid (i) == #Y FEAr F w7 F & T At 4o 3y

(1) % SiavTd USHIshoT AF9TF T2l ¢ |

9987 AT, FIATET Sgl o sorel e FTHE et &

qTeAw § VT AT AT TIE FAA AT A F U | o5
Fe T UTT U AT ATAHTw $T ey 22 T 3T 91T

o1 o6 |TeT TS
FATAT TT AT
TAYE 9 AT we T
IR

[FaaT TR

HET (iv) 3]

BIEHY), ST (i) & fore |

(i) TEAT, A 3T "@EATIA "erd (Rt e o




[9rT II-@vE 3(i)] RA A1 TSI ¢ SAHTER 5

() FY TEAT 26 F e Hiaw (3) °,-
F. AE () IT AT (T.) F TeATq AAferied 3T 7 & ofq:eAriv o som, == -
‘(=) HwT g R srferfaas, 1975 (1975 &1 51) it TIH SATAT % AT 42 AT 64 § AT AT FHHAM:
9L F AIEEL A7 Fefaaw & At

g. A (i) F T 9¥ T I "q4t4q (3), (4) 3% (5) Fr wtafs=t F war uw et i ateertug
[ERISIEUIADRIHE

3) 4) | (5)
“(iii) T T FaTh 25
(iv) I % TATHeT H o arer St awqen (wramt) F et £ f=r, swgE (i),
(i), (ii), (iiw) 3 (iii) & fo= |

(@) W TEAT 32 ¥ 399 gefdd vttt F v uw Aetertea i wiaearfa S s, em-

(1) (2) (3) 4) | (5)
“3p | o (i) FIT SHAE weTtE ¥ FIRT IS 3 wrenre i Far 6
9994 (ii) TRt i =T T FehoteT, IThT TTQMe ¥ e qur
FT qATAL A AT, IuFT (i) & foe

9

() F HEAT 34 F THe, HiAd (3),

F. WL (i) F T U AT IHY AT HiAd (3), (4) T (5) f wfafewi F wam ww Pwfatua =@
gfeeafua frar sroam, o -

(3) 4) | (5
“(iif) TSI qTeRt o oftw g, ATeT aThe, ST Trged, §09T TweEE, -
FIFET oft a1 & o7 97 | w391 F =7 H <Y A7 ATl F47 |
(iiiT) FARST A H v AT AARSE giagrsh, e Reaenms e v
29, FRAT, Y6 FAT 7 =T qurrg oF B iR W v i enfem g s | 14
THT 9g % T aTd AT &, § JA90 F w7 § &F S ATeq 9447 |

9

g. Ag (vi) §, FIc5F ST 3 “(iii)” F 978 Hivaw fT 30 “(iiish),” AT AT FATOT AT ST
(i) LT 2 % w7 g fAeterfera v staeerfoa G srosm, 7e: -

“IUaFd HTLUT & 9T (3) F HE (i); WL (iv) F 3T AS (@), 3T WS (), 3T AE (F), 3T UL (TF) T IT A (TW);
T (v) F 3T °HF (@), IT AL (), IT 0L (F) 3T ST AL (TF); < T (vi) F ST T (371) F wiew (3) & FfafEee T=r
& gt & Ao #, S w31 qfw % sfaarora Be, S ot fufa gy, &1 staeor anfaer gr ar veft sl v
qed I F T F qHEA SIS {6 Tl Arqfe o v gor wi § & v qfv av v qfa F gt e,
St oft Rurfa 21, % siaww Yog it gere yed g1 S UHT w3 a7 v 9y F afyarm Ren, S of Rufy

F AL G & forT g |TT STu O g Ut gl a7 aria ger wfer & uwh-fagrs grm |
TOSETHTOT — JUed TLTE 2 F ATH §, “Fref T & fam -

(F) STFT HATA & TAS § AT TIAH; T



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(=) Tt qfe F/Er ar Ut iy F aferioa e wT, S off Rafa g, siawor o= arfia wfen, e v siaer
T ugr AT 37 95T ff omfHT B, F A A

[T, /. 354/13/2018-&77]
= faee, s af==

AE:— e STTAT=AT 7 ATSEaT §%ar 11/2017-Fw=17 F¥ (33), fad® 28 S, 2017 F &7 & gr.47.4. 690 (31),
3T 28 57, 2017 F Tga YHTIAT 3ham 72T o 3fw T9H oifaw a1 srfere=mT dear 46/2017-4517 F7 (I7)
&t 14 Favaw, 2017, ar.a1.19. 1405 (31), f&AT® 14 Favaw, 2017 F g7 G By @ g |

MINISTRY OF FINANCE
(Department of Revenue)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 1/2018-Central Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.64(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 9, sub-section (1) of section 11,
sub-section (5) of section 15 and sub-section (1) of section 16 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of
2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, and on being satisfied that it is necessary in the
public interest so to do, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India,
in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue) No.11/2017- Central Tax (Rate), dated the 28"June, 2017, published
in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 690(E), dated the 28"June,
2017, namely:-

In the said notification,
@) in the Table, -

1. against serial number 3, in column (3), -
(A) in item (iv),-

(€8 for sub-item (c), the following sub-item shall be substituted, namely: -

‘(c) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “In-situ redevelopment of existing slums using land as a
resource, under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);’;

(I after sub-item (d), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(da) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “Economically Weaker Section (EWS) houses”
constructed under the Affordable Housing in partnership by State or Union territory or local authority or urban
development authority under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);

(db) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “houses constructed or acquired under the Credit
Linked Subsidy Scheme for Economically Weaker Section (EWS)/ Lower Income Group (LIG)/ Middle Income Group-1
(MIG-1)/ Middle Income Group-2 (MIG-2)” under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana
(Urban);’;

(II0) after sub-item (f), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 7

“(g) a building owned by an entity registered under section 12AA of the Income Tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961), which is
used for carrying out the activities of providing, centralised cooking or distribution, for mid-day meals under the mid-day
meal scheme sponsored by the Central Government, State Government, Union territory or local authorities.”;
(B) in item (v),

(1)) in sub-item (a), for the word “excluding”, the word “including” shall be substituted;

In after sub-item (d), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(da) low-cost houses up to a carpet area of 60 square metres per house in an affordable housing project which has been
given infrastructure status vide notification of Government of India, in Ministry of Finance, Department of Economic

Affairs vide F. No. 13/6/2009-INF, dated the 30th March, 2017;”;

©) for item (ix) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -

3) “ (5)
“(ix) Composite supply of works contract as
defined in clause (119) of section 2 of the Central Provided that where the services are supplied to
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a a Government Entity, they should have been
sub-contractor to the main contractor providing 6 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (iii) or item (vi) above entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
to the Central Government, State Government, Government, Union territory or local authority,
Union territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.
Authority or a Government Entity.
(x) Composite supply of works contract as defined
in clause.(l 19) of section 2 of the.Central Goods Provided that where the services are supplied to
and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a sub- a Government Entity, they should have been
contractor to the main contractor providing 25 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (vii) above to the ’ entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
Central Government, State Government, Union Government, Union territory or local authority,

territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.

Authority or a Government Entity.

(xi) Services by way of house-keeping, such as
plumbing, carpentering, etc. where the person

supplying such service through electronic Provided that credit of input tax charged on

2.5 goods and services has not been taken

commerce operator is not liable for registration . .
p & [Please refer to Explanation no. (iv)].

under sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017.

(xii) Construction services other than (i), (ii), (iii),
@iv), (v), (vi), (vii), (viii),(ix), (x)and (xi) above.

ii. against serial number 9, in the entry in column (3), in item (v), for the words “natural gas”, the words and brackets
“natural gas, petroleum crude, motor spirit (commonly known as petrol), high speed diesel or aviation turbine
fuel” shall be substituted;

iii. against serial number 10, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the
following shall be substituted, namely: -

3 G) &)
“(@i) Time charter of vessels for transport of Provided that credit of input tax charged on
goods. 25 goods (other than on ships, vessels
’ including bulk carriers and tankers) has not
been taken




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

[Please refer to Explanation no. (iv)].

(iii) Rental services of transport vehicles with

or without operators, other than (i) and (ii) 9 -7
above.
iv. for serial number 16 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely: -
()] 2 (3) @ | &
“16 | Heading @) Services by the Central Government, State Government,
9972 Union territory or local authority to governmental authority or | Nil -

government entity, by way of lease of land.

(i1) Supply of land or undivided share of land by way of lease or
sub lease where such supply is a part of composite supply of
construction of flats, etc. specified in the entry in column (3),
against serial number 3, at item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c),
sub-item (d), sub-item (da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-
item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v);

and sub-item (c) of item (vi). Nil )
Provided that nothing contained in this entry shall apply to
an amount charged for such lease and sub-lease in excess of one
third of the total amount charged for the said composite supply.
Total amount shall have the same meaning for the purpose of this
proviso as given in paragraph 2 of this notification.
(iii) Real estate services other than (i) and (ii) above. 9 -7
v. against serial number 17, for item (vii) in column (3), and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5),
the following shall be substituted, namely: -
3) “) (6)
“(vii) Time charter of vessels for Provided that credit of input tax
transport of goods. charged on goods (other than on
ships, vessels including bulk
2.5 carriers and tankers) has not been
taken
[Please refer to Explanation no.
(iv)].
(viii) Leasing or rental services, with or | Same rate of central
without operator, other than (i), (ii), | tax as applicable on
(iii), (iv), (v), (vi) and (vii) above. supply of like goods -
involving transfer of
title in goods.

vi. in serial number 23, against item (i) in column (3), in condition 1 in column (5), after the words “supplying the
service”, the words and brackets “, other than the input tax credit of input service in the same line of business (i.e.
tour operator service procured from another tour operator)” shall be inserted;

Vii. against serial number 23, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the
following shall be substituted, namely: -

3 “ ®)
“@i) Services by way of house-keeping, such as plumbing, Provided that credit of
carpentering, etc. where the person supplying such service through input tax charged on

goods and services has
not been taken
[Please refer to

electronic commerce operator is not liable for registration under | 2 5
sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax
Act, 2017. Explanation no. (iv)].

(iii) Support services other than (i) and (ii) above. 9 -7

Viii. against serial number 24,-



[ I-ETE 3(i)]

RA h1 ASUA : STHIYRO 9

iX.

Xi.

Xii.

(A) in the Explanation to item (i) in column (3), in clause (i), after sub-clause (g), the following sub-clause shall
be inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(B) for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

3 @ | &

“(@i) Service of exploration, mining or drilling of petroleum crude or natural gas or 6
both.

(iii)Support services to mining, electricity, gas and water distribution other than (ii) 9 ’
above.

such service through electronic commerce operator is

for serial number 25 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
€)) (2) 3 “ 5
“25 | Heading (i) Services by way of house-keeping, such as Provided that credit
9987 plumbing, carpentering, etc. where the person supplying of input tax charged

on goods and services

not liable for registration under sub-section (1) of 25 has not been taken

section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, [Please refer to
2017. Explanation no. (iv)].
(i) Maintenance, repair and installation (except 9 .

construction) services, other than (i) above. i

against serial number 26, in column (3),-

(A) initem (i), after sub-item (e), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(ea) manufacture of leather goods or foot wear falling under Chapter 42 or 64 in the First Schedule to the
Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51of 1975) respectively;”;

(B) for item (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -

3) CORNG)

“(iii) Tailoring services. 2.5 -

(iv) Manufacturing services on physical inputs (goods) owned by others, other than (i),
(ia), (ii), (iia) and (iii) above.

for serial number 32 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

(1) (2 3 @ |G

“32 | Heading (i) Services by way of treatment of effluents by a Common 6 )
9994 Effluent Treatment Plant.

(ii) Sewage and waste collection, treatment and disposal and 9 s

other environmental protection services other than (i) above. ’

against serial number 34, in column (3),-

(A) foritem (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

A3) @ | G
“(iii) Services by way of admission to amusement parks including theme parks, water
parks, joy rides, merry-go rounds, go-carting and ballet.

9 -

(iiia) Services by way of admission to entertainment events or access to amusement
facilities including exhibition of cinematograph films, casinos, race club, any 14 -7
sporting event such as Indian Premier League and the like.

(B) initem (vi), after the brackets and figures “(iii)”, the brackets and figures “(iiia),” shall be inserted;
(ii) for paragraph 2, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“2. In case of supply of service specified in column (3), in item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d), sub-item
(da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v); and sub-item
(c) of item (vi), against serial number 3 of the Table above, involving transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the
case may be, the value of such supply shall be equivalent to the total amount charged for such supply less the value of
transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be, and the value of such transfer of land or undivided
share of land, as the case may be, in such supply shall be deemed to be one third of the total amount charged for such
supply.
Explanation. —For the purposes of this paragraph, “total amount” means the sum total of,-
(a) consideration charged for aforesaid service; and

(b) amount charged for transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be including by way of lease or
sublease.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018-TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:— The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 11/2017 -
Central Tax(Rate), dated the 28"June, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 690 (E), dated the 28" June, 2017 and was last
amended by notification No. 46/2017-Central Tax (Rate), dated the 14 November, 2017 vide number G.S.R.
1405(E), dated the14™ November, 2017.

FfrEeT
7% faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

. 2/2018- FH T (V)

qr.#1.[. 65(3).—F=17 7T U FarEe afafaam, 2017 (2017 &1 12) &t g 11 F7 ST &M= (1) F agd
Taed ATRRAT T AN FId gU, Feg G 39 d1d § A5 21d gU o UAT FAT SAfed § dAa9d® g oY arug &
fERTiert & e 9%, TAgET, Aa ¥y, A wEverd (Tered fFamn) i afegEer @ear 12/2017- %5407 7
(3%), Taeier 28 S, 2017 fSora arar.fA. 691 (31) faAT 28 I, 2017 F Tgd WILT F TSI, AHTLTI F AR, TS
3, 3U-we (i) ® weriora o war o, ® i s oft et e wedt 8, 797 -
AT AfereEAT §, AR -
(F) w\ "EAT 3 F gHe Fwad (3) fF wfaf® &, avErdy wewry” sl F weArq ‘A "t AEry” ersat wr
I eniua e s, -
(@) FH §EaT 3 T 399 Hatad FAtsAt F qearq Metaied 77 9 T oY weatedy fiv siq:emfua & so,
T




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 11

(1) () @) (4) (5)

“pp | AATTO9 | WY F AqwuE 2437 F IAaud Al =@ w0 AT T T7;
g™ % aqeas 2439 F savq Rl T¥ A & =i
o Rt e F "efaa Rt Gramsen & Aterw ¥ F

AL, ToT FLRTE T e T &1 AT T ITR0r 91
LRI ITFEHTOT 7 AT [Fapra &7 < ST arelt "iel ue
Farelt i GYFT g S AT A IFT GqFT A AT
e THT AT % God & 25 Tiaerd & At T 87 |

() %9 "=AT 16 F 9, Hiaq (3) T FAT® §, “UF T o=al & w09 9T AT a9’ oreat w wioeartva A

STTUATT,
() FH HEAT 19 Y 399 "Eteq vEAtsat F veanq Meatatad 7 der e giafegy #iv s &Far s,
79T -
(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“19% | o 9965 | 9T ¥ fRua et Feery Feiioid T | =@ | T WA § fAfga g ff 319 30
¥ qd & arge foua Tt s o fRravae, 2018 ¥ a7 @ 7S 20 |
FTIATT F FIT TTA T TAGT FIA F
ATEAH F ¥ ST ATl 4T
197 | of§ 9965 | WTEd § fRuq fadt Fwerq Fofiavy w=om | 977 | 3@ whAfe & fAfga &g «ff s 30
¥ aead & arge Rug G vamm ™ ffawae, 2018 F 18 AN A51 g |
ST F FIT AT & TREET F3d &
ATEAH F <F ST ATl 4T

(T) #0EEAT 22 F 984, Fad (3) i ¥ATE #, 95 (@) F qearq, FeAferfag 7z # siqeamfog B s, 7o -
“(@1) U faret sfRE wr Rt stearaet siv aETRET F afaea ¥ e wew arga St ue Gerfor deem A
Tt sreamohl SfY FH=THAT & T T qar ware Far gr s {6 fermers 7d fF frar s areafas wqv an
THFE TF T [T & HTeTH & T HaT0 T&H F:ar 557

() w\ HEAT 29 F qwe =i 399 "eted wfafy % geurq Mfefaa ww g siw wafsat v siawntia G

STTUNTT, F4T: -

(1) () ©) (4) (5)

“9g% | ofif 9971 | Fx WLHR AT AMRF dHT ASATA K AT TAF F | LF T
ar ofy§ | PAENTCAT T AAT T TOATEA HE F WILTH H T hi S
9991 ATt AT J=T 360 ST % Forg argafa < 7 st oftar #ad |

(%) &0 @ear 36 F gHe, How (3) f qAf® #, wg (1) F “Uw0g A &l F €A UL G AT AT AT

gfaeenfua faar s,
(ST) %w wweaT 36 Y 399 Hefaq TATSat & Teanq Meafatad 7 SeT e qiafegy #iv sia.earaq &Far s,

T -



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(1) 2) 3) (4) (5)
“36% | ofif 9971 ar | FH HEAT 35 AT 36 H Mt AT Arsrwrat F I I o
o 9991 FAAT F AT | & T ATAT HATE

(A)  FH AT 39 37 I9H Hataq gfatedt & ge=rq, Mmfofaa w7 @ i sfateat wiv yiaetoa B s,
T -
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“39% | ofrf 9971 | Flt &g oram arar far snfdw s= & Rua A= Jamat & areea | =7 =T
ST Sevqae wreafome affas dex (srduwuasl) w2 g, F
BT AT % argY Rud et ares v stawrsdia facdt et &
forw et =aw & fe et sreg et & €Y 1S Fard
T (- T UTETE & 3297 & oy, emsuwuaey § et darar
& WL F AT UH =01 9 3,
(i) o8 e g 7 =9 [Afvc sqata a1 wrerar & g 3T G
AR i 7 =v At aqufy & 2 a1 S adowoash &
fafeerae & foro e &S fafaamaes & % w0 § aregar < g, am
(ii) For&r FAesht g wegw (s et @ wew) A,
2015 % AT AT o ATZT FT s (FAEN =afF T 797 27, 37
(i) ST 3wt fmr BT ve A st (saeasa
el ar =) ¥ Ron-f¥er, 2015 F At sweUwUEET ST
gtersrdy o =9 | vsfiga g1, a7
(iii) o et afaqfa v fAfFw aE, @) 7 adm st
g fafama e (siaeasd, facdi e Feg) fRom-fAder, 2015 %

ST =9 Ated SaAta ya 1 21 |

(31) %W HEAT 45 F THe, Fiw (3) i yf=At® 7 -

i. WE (F), 3T AL (i) F TeATq, FeAferiad 3T A F sfd e AT ST, T9T-

“(iii) v TERTL, TST TLHRTL, T ST &, TITATT FTIAFHLOT, ALRTET ITIAFHL0T AT qEar<t =ar;”;

i, g (@), 37 WL (iii) F TeATq, FMeAterEa 3T A Fr s e G s, 7w

“(iv) g AT, TST TLATL, T T[T &, TATAT T, FLATL ST T FLFhT A1,

iii. WF (M), 37 9L (i) F weATq, FeAforiET 3T A F s EATiUd T S, 7T

“(iii) g TLRTT, TST TLHTL, T TS &, T TTARTT, LT ITFRFT0r A7 qeahr<y foar 17

() | e 53 37 3a9 "atad wfafeat % vearq Aeafafa ww d@er s vt @i saeafia B s,

T -

(1) () ) (4) (5)

“53% | oftf 9985 | FIT ITATET & AT | AT & WILAH § & ST ATl HaTd T | o=




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 13

(3) FW H9EAT 54 F 98, Faw (3) i GATE ¥ 72 (F), F TeAq Mt 98 #i e B s, 769m-

“(ST) T SUTET F TALETSHI | gHF F HIEAT F <F ST qTeA] qaT |
() #w =e=Ar 60 F THeA, Hiaw (3) it AP § arsz “Frer warers,” & fAefaa fram sromm, o
() | HEAT 65 307 3aY "ated wfafeat ¥ vearq Aeafafa ww d@er e wafsat @i saeafia B s,

T9T; -
(1) 2 (3) (4) (5)

“65% | o7 9991 | F=AT & AfAwTT arfarfazw, 2005 (2005 #T 22) F siavia LT | =
ST T&TH F2A % HTeq® F &1 S et Harg

(Y1)  FW HEAT 66 F THA, Hew (3) it yfAT® F -
i. WE(F) F Te=Tq, AEtotaa 78wt wtoerfud B srosm, 7om-
‘() ToreT Qreaforen HEAT BTRT YA o F FT H Awe & Uasl § FA9T THAT F AT F:h & ST
ATt FAT;”
ii. ¥ @) H,-

(F) 3IT-9% (iv) |, “ ATEATHE T T6” Tal I (AL a7 ST,

(@) 379 (iv), % Tearq, FAeaferfaa 3o ag & siaeanfog B s, 7om-
“(v) TSTHIA SR IT TS dhed T ot are o

() u=q ®, oTex, FItoh AT qAT “IHATS (@)’ F €I I 958, FITsH A¥ FT ‘A (F) % 37 97 (i), (ii)
A (jii) 7 1 gfeeTioq BT s,

() TReqE & TeATq (AT Teeq® F st e T S, 7em-
“gord e ff B3 7= (@) F 37 7% (v) § Wi w2 oft arq UE dearet 9w 96 98t gri o, -
(i) e & foraT T S==a¥ Areatie Ta¥ a@ AT THHE T qh (9027 F |reaq 9, 47
(ii) et sTmiTeT =ameaTias freT qrewa & UF fBe0 & w7 § a7 % Are7w ¥ 9«1 Fa7 7
ELR
(A) F "=AT 77 F G0, Fiaw (3) Ft w&ATS |, 7% (1) H 97 FATL” 9511 F T T G gL T+ |l 95T HT
st AT Srosm, 741m-

(F)  Fw FEAr 81 F g0, wiaw (3) it wfAf® F v = fMw=ferfea afate #r yheantia e srom, gom-

‘et ® saer F At % w9 § & S arelt 949y -

() T, T AT Farue-A=e s qresh a7 5o | ot g;

(&) TERTE THTUE, Sa TaRg A §re st Sfta ssoe ar #rg et S % wrear g fer
AT | 19+ BT;




14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(3T) HT=IET T SHIST THTE;
(%) AT,
STET ITAFT 0T (F), (@), (1) IT (F) § 797 AT THTG IT TITA0 H T 5 AT 7 Ffawer 500 F0 sfr
=R T ATF TG |
[T, %.354/13/2018 -&rame]

=t foee, s afea

qE :— T ATSFEAT F&AT 12/2017-F17 T (IX), fZA1H 28 57, 2017 #r ar.#1. 691 (31), fa=iw 28 4,
2017 & qgad AT & TSI, AATLTION, o TET-11, ©e-3, ST-TT (i) H Rt fBrar 3w o7 e zow sifaw
T AFAGAAT HEAT 47/2017-F7 FT (37) 3w 14 Fawaw, 2017 SF aranf 1406 (1) i
14 FaF<, 2017 & qgd 9T % TSI, STETEN, F AW- 1, @=-3, IT-6 (i) § Fhrior o 7w o, &
FTT Ty foRar AT 2 |

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 2/2018- Central Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 65(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 11 of the Central Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest
so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of
the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.12/2017- Central Tax (Rate), dated
the 28"June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number
G.S.R. 691(E), dated the 28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the words “
or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely: -

@ @ 3) @ 5)
“3A Chapter 99 | Composite supply of goods and services in which the value of | Nil Nil”;
supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of the
value of the said composite supply provided to the Central
Government, State Government or Union territory or local
authority or a Governmental authority or a Government Entity
by way of any activity in relation to any function entrusted to a
Panchayat under article 243G of the Constitution or in relation
to any function entrusted to a Municipality under article 243W
of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three years” shall
be substituted;



[ I-ETE 3(i)]

AR <pT TSTAA ¢ SHTERIT

15

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following
inserted, namely: -

serial number and entries shall be

0 @) 3) @) 8)

“19A Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
of goods by an aircraft from number shall apply after the
customs station of clearance in 30" day of September, 2018.
India to a place outside India.

19B Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
of goods by a vessel from customs number shall apply after the
station of clearance in India to a 30" day of September, 2018.7;
place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely: -

“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of

transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of pre-
school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -
(1 ) 3) 4) Q)
“29A | Heading Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided by | Nil Nil”;
9971 ) or | the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of Coast Guard
I;;;?mg under the Group Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.
(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the words
“two lakhs” shall be substituted;
(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -
ey (©)) 3 ) 6)
“36A Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | specified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely: -

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary
of financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the Government
of India or any Regulator appointed for regulation of IFSC;
or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under the
Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and

) ) 3) “) &)
“39A Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a | Nil Nil”;
9971 multi services SEZ with International Financial Services




16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Development Authority of India (International Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI) under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

(j) against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3).-
iv. initem (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

v. initem (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

vi. initem (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

€)) @) 3 “ (&)
“53A | Heading 9985 Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of | Nil Nil”;
agricultural produce.

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,” shall be
omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

@ ) 3 “@ Q)
“65A | Heading 9991 Services by way of providing information under the Right | Nil Nil”;
to Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
i.  after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee;”;

ii. initem (b),-
A. in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

B. after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

C. in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letters “sub-items (i),
(ii) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;

D. after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-


Venkatesh
Highlight

Venkatesh
Highlight


[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 17

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or

(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the words
“seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -
“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised
sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)
above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:—  The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 12/2017

- Central Tax (Rate), dated the ZSthune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 691 (E), dated the ZSthune, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No.47/2017 - Central Tax (Rate), dated the 14 November, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1406(E), dated the 14 November, 2017.

FrfergET
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

. 3/2018-F=1 FX ()

AT.H1.F. 66 (31).—Fe=17 ATer Ue Farwe wferfaaw, 2017 (2017 &1 12) & &=y 09 fit 37 &< (3) F d=a

waed ofxRdl T WART F3d g0, Feg Gy, qug i Aerfien F srar uw, vaegnr, wwa aeEr, o g
(Trotea fawm) it stfergEeT "eaT 13/2017-F07 F¥ (%), faais 28 5[, 2017 S arar.fA. 692 (3r) fa=i+ 28 9,
2017 % qgd AT o TISTT, SIETLT0T o AW- 11, @ 3, I39-8< (i) § wehrfera foam s o, § i s oft Referfea
oMY FAT g, TAT -

IFq Aferg=T H, -

(i)

qreelt #, w9 TEAT 5 Y 39q "qataa wfafai & gewq, Metafa w0 d@er siw sug gatea gttt i

st eTia Rt ST, -

(1)

(2) 3) (4)

“5%

FeT AT TS 4T w AT, 2017 (2017 7 | Frg TR, TSF | Feald AT U HaT FT AAAT,
12) ¥ faviq ustiga Y =afRF #1 o= gufy #1 | 99, 99 T | 2017 F dqud geigd s off
PR 97 3T ey G, ST TR, T T o | HA AT FAAT | AT |

a7 weTefier SfReRoT 3 e A S ATt T | STt




18

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(ii)

o

FTCEFTOT |, 3T TR (T.) F 7991 Arteria Iuares v siq:era R sros, a9

L

‘(=) Pt srfirrat w7 st a8 2 S e foro fimr s, 1938 (1938 #7 4) Y gwT 2 %

ITETHT (10) ®§ far g 1 |

ERIE A

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 3/2018- Central Tax (Rate)

[T %.354/13/2018- &rame]

= foee, saw e
ST Afg=eT "eAT 13/2017-F417 F2 (3X), f&a7F 28 5, 2017 Fr ar.a1.4 692 (31), f&=tF 28 57, 2017
& qgd W o TSI, AL, F AN- 11, T<-3, IT-T< (i) § Fehriora B @m o i o sifaw s
A=A TEaT 33/2017-Fw=1 w2 (3%) faq7® 13 srerqae, 2017 @ ararnf 1275 (3r) ot 13 saqew,
2017 % qEd WILd % TSI, FATHT, F AN-1I, T=-3, IT-TE (i) § ThTiera FoFar s o, % grer g

G.S.R.66(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 9 of the Central Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the
following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of
Revenue), No.13/2017- Central Tax (Rate), dated the 28"June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 692(E), dated the 28"June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification,-

@) in the Table, after serial number 5 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and the entries
relating thereto shall be inserted, namely: -
M @ 3) “
“5A Services supplied by the Central Government, State Government, | Central Any person
Union territory or local authority by way of renting of immovable | Government, State | registered
property to a person registered under the Central Goods and Services Government, under  the
Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017). Union territory or | Central
local authority Goods and
Services
Tax Act,
2017.7;

(i) in the Explanation, after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(f) “insurance agent” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (10) of section 2 of the Insurance

Act, 1938 (4 of 1938).".

[F. No. 354/13/2018- TRU]

RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:— The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 13/2017 -
Central Tax (Rate), dated the 28th June, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 692 (E), dated the 28thJune, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No. 33/2017 - Central Tax (Rate), dated the 13th October, 2017 vide number

G.S.R. 1275 (E), dated the 13th October, 2017.




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 19

=T
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

. 4/2018-FH7 X (V)

qT.H.A.67(31.).—F1 7T U TarRe Aftafaaw, 2017 (2017 #7 12) F¥ 9T 148 F dgd Yacd awdl &1
TIRT Fd gU, Feg TLATT, THOF T TARTTELN & e T, Ushiga oApat it feafortaa Sfort #r oiq -

(F) U UsiiFa =AfF S F B A, faee, At s o1 s Frs oS satw # i G afwws
TES H, qUid: I7 st T Frraesr, fAfeE ar fwtr @v=er F oo [[uter e ¥ = § fGwm F
FfarTe 1 39 §; 3T
(@) TH usiEa Atw S T e F i #7739 e w1 R wiowe F uasr |, quias 3T sferd:
forema % arfareme & siavor & w7 # Gt wrerees, waq a1 [{Eior w=En & Fwtr fi aar i e
FAE,
&I U Tofighd saRaT o6 =T § TTEE=d Fedl g o 7ot § SUdad Sara (F) § gafdq [t Jar F =7 § yre
TIIer 9% AT ITAFT ITATHT (@) H Gafdq et & It F &7 § wreq Siawer 9%, IFd Fa7 i a9 Feaid
T I AT J11Aed 3T q0T TG G ST IF S, faeee, FAutor suet a1 s #1g dsfispa sat<r, S ofF fufy
g1, ta Al wreae, waw = [fae At 1 F Feor a1 Afeeme 7 7w 39 =3{<k & Fear g S v T
siaeor oo 31 Tt wehr o srer TRt oo (S o streie o) o gearere Feh siaid #ar g |

[T. ©.354/13/2018- 1=m77]
& fae, sEw qta

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 4/2018-Central Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 67(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 148 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act,
2017 (12 of 2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby notifies the following
classes of registered persons, namely :-

(a) registered persons who supply development rights to a developer, builder, construction company or any other
registered person against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of construction service of complex, building or civil
structure; and

(b) registered persons who supply construction service of complex, building or civil structure to supplier of development
rights against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of transfer of development rights,

as the registered persons in whose case the liability to pay central tax on supply of the said services, on the consideration
received in the form of construction service referred to in clause (a) above and in the form of development rights referred
to in clause (b) above, shall arise at the time when the said developer, builder, construction company or any other
registered person, as the case may be, transfers possession or the right in the constructed complex, building or civil
structure, to the person supplying the development rights by entering into a conveyance deed or similar instrument (for
example allotment letter).

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

FfgET
7% fewett, 25 StrareT, 2018

TEIT 5/2018- FET FX ()

T.H1.fA. 68(ar.).—F= T U U HaATHT A=W, 2017 (2017 7 12) F¥ & 11 T 3T €17 (1)
F TEd Tacq TRl T AN FTd gU, Fex AYaTE, 38 910 § HqCE gid gU 1o UAT FIAT SHied | aed® g
ST afvuE AT [RRTell % e Y, Tqaanl, Fod GSiiordd AT TTHdE T8 T 1 & A0 IT G 6
T AT=H AT TET T 6T AT ATSAT HATA Al A TSHT ST T Feai T FT F I g2 qh e adl g o
g2 TF I WiThe TLIo@T § g T3 & (80, 360 AT | Frg GO GRT 7 T0 Jqae § J97
FyTha, % =T H Frx G R AT T ST ATl TTAH T AT SATAT 6 |

[T, §.354/13/2018- E.PBTIT{]
= fate, eew qt=e

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 5/2018- Central Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.68(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 11 of the Central Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest
so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby exempts the intra-State supply of services by way of grant of
license or lease to explore or mine petroleum crude or natural gas or both, from so much of the central tax as is leviable
on the consideration paid to the Central Government in the form of Central Government’s share of profit petroleum as
defined in the contract entered into by the Central Government in this behalf.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

i@
7% faeett, 25 s9atT, 2018

HEAT 1/2018- THIFT T (V)

qT.F1.A. 69(31). —F= TTer U At wfafAawy, 2017 (2017 #71 12) & 131 15 ¥ I74™T (5) 79T 917 16 F

ITYTT (1) F AT 9fsd Thishd AT U &aT FT Afeftaaw, 2017 (2017 1 13) i gy 5 &F 37 &mer (1), &=T 6 # 37
1T (1), TAT 12T 20 & @ (jii), TF @2 (iv) § Taeq ARAT F1 TN T gU, Feg G201, TUE it e 7w ua 75
AMeawd g U o UET FeAT A B # S&r g, 9 aa, focq warery (Terea o) fir srteg=Er w@ear 08/2017
THIHd FE (3¥) T 28 S, 2017 S % 9 F TSI, FHTLTI, G2 ||, GRT 3, 3T AW (1) | 91474, Teqr 683 (3),
3T 28 S, 2017 =1 WaTiord gam &, § v gerver wedt g 797 -

S ST H,

(i) aTeoft #, -

(F) w9 HEAT 3 F g9, wied (3) 7, -

F. 7% (iv) H,




[ I-ETE 3(i)]

RA h1 ASUA : STHIYRO 21

®

(ii)

(iii)

®
(i)

T.

IT ¥ () F w1 9 Aemterfaa v wiaeertoa far so, =em-

“(m) =ft = Torw e (erg) frera/same #eft e TS (gEY) F Sad SfH T UF F9re F =
H TN Fd U aq AT Wio afEat w1 T e e [T,

IT 7T () F oAt Aeferfaa 3w wal #r sfa-earioa B S, 7o9m-

“(=rF) &g fRmtor ST 47 o= g gt fAwtor et S % a4t % forg srare (o) e/ a=ft
ATETH AT (L) F A Toq/FH T /EAT 1 Irfaraeor/argdr faeme arfarseor & gy anfiar
F T TRIST ZISTET & dgd s &  wusn< 791 & forw fAfdq swarat & gafaa 2r;

(Fr@) FE TRATr AT AT 7T e g Auior wrd S G q4dt F orw e (ogd) Mem/ga w5t
ATETH ATSAT (L) F AT ATTF =T F FHSNT FM (STee 0/ T T/ (TAASST)/HETHT AT
-1 (THATES-1)/AETH T -2 (THATES(1-2) T Heifarq wise foieh Meady ofim F oiasia Al ar
FterfEa aeTet & "ated g7,

I AT (F) F qeATq AFAfererd 3T /&l & efq:eamiua fHam S, 7m;-

“(=) AT waa s 5 vE R Per ¥ i § g1 S s sfafaEm, 1961 (1961 #T 43) F
AT ISIiEHd gl, SEET TN Feg A, TS YR, §9 ST &7 AT T ATIFO % F10
TSI HEATEA AISIT ATSAT % SIaid HedTed TSI &l T&I9 2, Feaq & F T FA AT IHHT
e #w & wrd # o Srar |,

T (v) H,

IT UL (F) T “TISFT e F T T “THT” e FT Traeumioq & sruam,

3T HE (F) F TeAT AFATET 37 &1 F S TATioT R S, 74,

“(F) et TS a gTSfET TRATSHT F A aqTy M0 HET FHF St Frde UhAr 60 a7 #iew
ot weRre g1 et e |, o warer, st araer % forwmr i srfasg==, @, 7.13/6/2000-
SEUATE, FIATF 30 W, 2017 F TEq SAAHTHAT T &1 (24T AT 2L

e (ix) o 399 gafeq gy, Faw (3), (4) T (5) #, F vora 9 fAferfaa w1 sfawerfog

STTURTT, T9T:-

(3)

(%)

“(ix) FT AT UF FarEe afefaam, 2017 #¥
g 2 F et (119) # Femgfearioa fAafer
aqay T "@YFd g, o1 fF B 3T TEEw
ST H=A S%aTE AT &1 T8 g1 ST T I (iii) T

Ferd o et Ut Fary fohet sy e i
T T ST TET 8, a8l SRl S 7ahT FTET
AT I AT FT F HeAg § AT A L @l S

Vi) ¥ FffEe e A e e, TeT 12 & SO Feg T, TS 99T, 9 S 9
T, W 5T AT B T a1 T T STTEaRTor, ST o fearfa g gmen
Tt rfarswer a1 Rt gy e @ yere ST T E |

FAT 2l |

(x) FET AT UF FET g, 2017 #i Ford o Stgt U Faro el gewrd e v
T 2 % TTATET (119) § worafvarieg fmfor | g5 | T BTG, ARl AN I Fopr gre

aqay T dYFT arqra, or fF R 3T TeEw

AT I [FHTOT FT o Here H AT A TS 2l A
% ST Feg AT, TS O, T ST 87




22

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(®)

FTT T SHaTT 1 &l 8 g off T Suar (vii) &
fafafdce qarett #1 Feg TR, TST AR, T

sy AT R TqTE wifeERwr A g
STierReer A7 et I AT 7 ST T gr

T T wTteERer, S off fufa g F g
HI9T 79T 2T |

(xi) =¥ T T@AT F T F <7 AT ATAT AATT S
o watew, swufdr sgr & soaetfher w e
AT F qTeqw F T vt F7 997 w4 a1

Ford o AT UE FATeA 9T AT TAE <o i
FeT T o T BT |

5
=ik & o FehT arer ue el afafam f ﬁ N .
GTT 22 T 3T &7 (1) F i o 1ol a9TH [Fe I (1v) )
T
(xii) Frmtor Famd < £ 3w (1), (i), (iil), (iv), 5

(v), (vi), (vii), (viii),(ix), (x) 3% (xi) & fo= 2T |

(@) FH TEAT 9 F THer, Hiad (3) Fit v #, 75 (v) F “Yhias T 91T F T I TR T, FoAT Teriera,

Arex fEaftve (R s 9219 % 98 F ST a1 €), g ofte diee a7 UEued gared T gaeat &

gfeenfua frar smo |

7= fAeferfea w1 wfaeanfua frar sroam, ae-

(M) FH AT 10 F THe, Faw (3) § 72 (i) F =0T 9T 9T FeAw (3), (4) A7 (5) H 399 "qetyq yfatvAqt F o

©)

(4)

)

“(ii) ATl FT AT T AT TAATAT FT
ZTEH AT

Ford & AT (SR, Seaw, e o
FER o SR o 9T 2, ¥ Uue) W
ATRA T 2o At hiee 7 off T8 2

[FAT FASEHT HEAT (iv) TE]

(iii) wfEgs argat & AT ATAF T FAAT
o =mere & R = 39 A FaT, 3 (i)
< (i) & vt |

18

FY TEAT 16 AT 399 "ataa yiEfsa & v wx ffeferfera #r wieesrioa frar s, e -

(1) ()

(3)

@ | ©

“16 | ofiT 9972

(i) g 1 9z T fRU 9 F GTeAT ¥ Feg aa, 5T a1,
T TS AT T JTIH0T o g7 et gt wrfaraeor a7
et gy R 7 < ST Ao 94Ty |

A

(il) % =T 37 7% F e ¥ G sy v g F afawfsa fw

# g stet o U oI wE (i); 799 (iv) F ST 9% (W), 3T 6%
@), ST °E (F), IT 9 (IF) 3T 3T AL (T@); UL (V) F ST A%
(@), 3T 7T (1), 3T HE (F) < 3T HE (IF) U 7T (vi) F 3T A

LA




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 23

(M) # FF "5edT 3 F g9 qAr® F wiaw (3) ¥ AAEe wer
afe = fAmTor it wgFa argfd w1 uE e g |

Ford 5 za wiate & [ #r «ff a9 09 g 77 3v-ug
T AT 39 TRt TOfr 9% g At g S R Sa SgEa g
T ATRT T I % TF faars & AfaF g1 | 39 ToqH & 9a4 o
‘gt TITA T AFAITT FET ET S gEeh forw g st &
T 2 fear AT B

(iii) Soa (i) AT (ii) & 72 Huer ez qam0 18

() FH HEAT 17 F ey FAq qear (3) ¥ 7 (vii) F T 9T 97 FaAw (3), (4) @ (5) T & T 39 Hafdq
gfafeat F v ux fAterfera v sfaeerfog G sto, 7o -

) (4) ©)

“(vil) AT FT TRART T AT TATTHT Ford & UF ATer (S R S,
T ITEH FTET s, R aew Fhaw @
5 T ft o €, § @9 "rEE ¥

qoTF) TR & T wfee 7 At T

2T [FIIT TSR |5 (iv) 39

(viii) TZT AT BTy #Y fa =T arrvew | THEd B A TE
afim & am T, S Br I (), (i), | e

(iii), (iv), (v), (vi) ST (vii) ¥ g & | : ngj m;

sy oft entfaer 2,
EE I (I
arl

(=) FH AT 23 % 90 o 1 ¥, Fiad (3) f W& (i) ¥ GGt fraw (5) i wiafe §, “Fareii f g, o8 &
TIAT “, T WAT o =TT (S T et s 22 aravew & <ft € 22 sravew Aa) § e F4Areh & e
wiee § for=” 1 eiqeafog B s

(=) W TEAT 23 F g0 FAN (3) F A (i) F TATH UL TAT 399 AT Hwd (3), (4) A (5) i gfAfE=i F wamw
7= fAeferfea #r wfaeanfua frar smoam, -

@) (4) (5)

“(ii) =% ¥ FEreTer F = & & S ATt A 5w, Ford B AT v AT
ST B TomE o FTAE ATYaY ¥ HTeAn & e = A = wr ATi TAYE T A wee
a1er =zt 3 R ekt Ao e v At A e 22 fr 3w | 5 | 7R e |

TRT (1) 3 AT TSI RL0T AELAF Tl ¢ | e -

(iv) =€

(iil) T Fam S IR (i) 3 (i) & fre at | 18

(1) FY TEAT 24 F e HiaH (3),-



24 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]
(i) * =z & wfaf® § fauw qu ersdiwwor §, Srar (i) § ST STarE (8) % oA At swares #5r
e fr s, -

“(ST) FT ITUTET o IIT GIIAT H AT & qTeqT § & AT ATl 8T,
(i) F 9= (i) F B9 IT 9T I9Y AT FAT (3), (4) AT (5) Fr yfFtRAt F v w FAtataa w@
gfaeafua frar s, -
3) 4) | (5)
“(ii) F == TSTTTIH /AT ITHFAH TH F A7T0T, AT AT ST 6T FqaT 12 -
(iii) ==, fEega, i i Ster Sterawor it wgrae 9T S 6 3weEd (i) 7 fae gt 18
(=) F HEAT 25 A< 3T Hatag TAteai & w7 u¥ Fetorfaa s wieeertoa G o, 7om-
(1) 2 (3) (4) (5)
“25 | ofid (i) =% F¥ FEA F w7 F & T A G4 5y g:iﬁﬁqu
9987 YR ; T AT
mﬁv,m@ﬁvwﬁ%%ﬁ%@’rﬁwmm% e e e
ATEAH | UHT FATA FT TIF FIA AT SAE F 0 [ g ST |
FeT AT T TR AT it 9Ty 22 Y 3T 9m=T :
(1) 3 ST TfTshoT ST97F T2 3 | [
TET (iv) T9]
(i) T@WT, FOEHT T qeq= Fare (et w e #5r 8
BIEHY), ST (i) & fore |
() T HEAT 26 F TAA FieAA (3) H,-

@

)

(F) 7= (i) 3T A (T.) F 99T ATrad 37 98 1 sia.earraa & Srua, 74w -

“(z.7) HAT 9o < arferfamw, 1975 (1975 &1 51) &iT TIH ST & FALATT 42 AT 64 § T AT FHA:

THE % AIETL A7 Fefaaw & it

(@) |= (iii) 3 =TT 9T T IEE "@AAT (3), (4) AT (5) Fr wHATRAT F v wx FAretortaT wr wiaweiua
[ERISIEUIADRIHE

(3) 4) | (5)
“(iif) Terfiar = | 5
(iv) TEE % TAT8eT & o aTer St awqen (wramt) F et £ f=m, swgE (i),
(i), (ii), (i) M (iii) & fo= |

18

FY TEAT 32 T 399 "atag wiEfsa F v uw fAeterfea w5 wieesfoa B s, e -

(1) 2 3) 4) | (9
“3p | o (i) FIT SHAE veTte ¥ FIRT IS 3 wiene i Far 12

9994 (ii) TRersT i ST T FehoteT, IThT TTQTe ¥ e qur
qT qATAL A AT, ITFT (i) & foe

18

F HEAT 34 F THe, HiAd (3),



[ 9T [I-8vE 3(i)] YR T TSI : STHTHROT 25

(F) W= (i) F TE 9L AT IqN HAAG HAq (3), (4) A (5) Fr wfafPAr F waw o Fe=tefea w
gfaeeanfua frar sroam, T -

3) 4 | (3
“(iii) TSI aTeRt o oftw uTeE, ATe uTee, Wi TEed, 8 Tsed, M-
LT ot o 8 % f ¥ 999 & &9 § & J JTAt T4 |
(iii®) AAST HHTE § YO AT FAESA giagret, S fevermE fhew #71
TR, HTEAT, T e 7 hieT auig oF fF e e A sfr enfoer g eiie | 28 | -
THT 9g % 3T 9Td AT &, F J99T F &7 § ¥ S ATeq 9447 |

18 -

(=) e (vi) o, FIosw T 3 “(jii)” F a7 FICSF AL FF “(jiiF),” FT AqETOq B S,
(i) TErUTE 2 % T 9 Ao s afaeerrfa G s, e -

“2. IUHFT ATV F FH HeAr (3) F we (i); WL (iv) F 3T 9 (@), ST H (M), IT G (F), IT U (IF) AT 3T 7
(=r@); W= (v) F 3T Ue (@), IT UL (1), ST AL (F) AT 3T AL (F); ML AL (vi) F 37 A< (1) F Frew (3) # fafAfEes
Far it gt & 7w ®, S iy 7 9 F afFaoe fF % e, S of Rufy 2, #1 saer arfder g ar
THT AT AT qod 6 FT A F FHGeA FA S b Y A 0w Ard gor wiy # q vy ofw av oAy qfv F
srfararfora fReq, St «ft Rafa g, % siawor gor v "ers yrea R ofw T qff ¥ a1 oy afy * sfaara /e,
ST oft Rafa g1, % siawor e F forw 7rg 7T ST 5 ag U srqf uw Wi gt e #7 uE-fagrs g
TSR — ST TLTE 2 F ATH |, “Fref T & fam -

() ST FATA F TS § AT TIAHT; 3T

(@) THT sy /Y 37 vt qiE F srfaarior e w/A, S oft fRafa g, siaor ww arfia wfer, e v siawor

o ugr/3T ugr Y enfAe g, FAMH LN

[®T. ¥.354/13/2018- ﬁ'ﬂ'l'{'{]
= face, s afz=
AE:— T sAteeEaT anaLE. §gar 702 (3), &7 28 I, 2017 F a8 Atag=ar §0. 11/2017 — &9 T=q&=+
T (3X), faAT® 28 S, 2017 F T 9T F TSI, FAeer § wHfoq & T o aqrar{. wgEn
1407(zr), i 14 Fawaw, 2017 % T2 SATAHAAT HEAT 46/2017- THFT F7 (37) s 14 Fawaw, 2017

ZTT 9 ifaw gerrer ¥ = o |

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 1/2018-Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 69(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 5, sub-section (1) of section 6
and clause (iii) and clause (iv) of section 20 of the Integrated Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (13 of 2017) read with
sub-section (5) of section 15 and sub-section (1) of section 16 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of
2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, and on being satisfied that it is necessary in the
public interest so to do, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India,
in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No. 8/2017- Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 28th June, 2017,
published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 683(E), dated the
28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification,

(i) in the Table, -



26 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(a) against serial number 3, in column (3), -
(A) initem (iv),

(I)  for sub-item (c), the following sub-item shall be substituted, namely: -

‘(c) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “In-situ redevelopment of existing
slums using land as a resource, under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana
(Urban);’;

(I) after sub-item (d), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(da) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “Economically Weaker Section (EWS)
houses” constructed under the Affordable Housing in partnership by State or Union Territory or local
authority or urban development authority under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri
Awas Yojana (Urban);

(db) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “houses constructed or acquired under
the Credit Linked Subsidy Scheme for Economically Weaker Section (EWS)/ Lower Income Group
(LIG)/ Middle Income Group-1 (MIG-1)/ Middle Income Group-2 (MIG-2)” under the Housing for All
(Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);’;

(ITI)  after sub-item (f), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -
“(g) a building owned by an entity registered under section 12AA of the Income Tax Act, 1961 (43 of
1961), which is used for carrying out the activities of providing, centralised cooking or distribution, for
mid-day meals under the mid-day meal scheme sponsored by the Central Government, State
Government, Union territory or local authorities.”;

(B) initem (v),
(D in sub-item (a), for the word “excluding”, the word “including” shall be substituted;

(II) after sub-item (d), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(da) low-cost houses up to a carpet area of 60 square metres per house in an affordable housing project
which has been given infrastructure status vide notification of Government of India, in Ministry of

Finance, Department of Economic Affairs vide F. No. 13/6/2009-INF, dated the 30th March, 2017;”;

(C) for item (ix) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,

namely: -
3 “ 5

“(ix) Composite supply of works contract as
defined in clause (119) of section 2 of the Central Provided that where the services are supplied to
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a a Government Entity, they should have been
sub-contractor to the main contractor providing 12 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (iii) or item (vi) above entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
to the Central Government, State Government, Government, Union territory or local authority,
Union territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.
Authority or a Government Entity.
(x) Composite supply of works contract as defined
in clause (119) of section 2 of the Central Goods Provided that where the services are supplied to
and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a sub- a Government Entity, they should have been
contractor to the main contractor providing 5 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (vii) above to the entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
Central Government, State Government, Union Government, Union territory or local authority,
territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.
Authority or a Government Entity.




[ I-ETE 3(i)]

RA h1 ASUA : STHIYRO 27

(®)

(©)

(d)

(e)

(xi) Services by way of house-keeping, such as
plumbing, carpentering, etc. where the person

supplying such service through electronic

Provided that credit of input tax charged on

@iv), (v), (vi), (vii), (viii), (ix), (x) and (xi) above.

5 goods and services has not been taken
commerce operator is not liable for registration ) )
under sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central [Please refer to Explanation No. (iv)].
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017.

(xii) Construction services other than (i), (ii), (iii), 18 ,

against serial number 9, in the entry in column (3), in item (v), for the words “natural gas”, the words and brackets

“natural gas, petroleum crude, motor spirit (commonly known as petrol), high speed diesel or aviation turbine

fuel” shall be substituted;

against serial number 10, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the

following shall be substituted, namely: -

3 “ &)
“(@i) Time charter of vessels for transport of Provided that credit of input tax charged on
goods. goods (other than on ships, vessels
5 including bulk carriers and tankers) has not
been taken
[Please refer to Explanation No. (iv)].
(iii) Rental services of transport vehicles with
or without operators, other than (i) and (ii) 18 -7
above.

for serial number 16 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

@ 2

(€)

@16

“16 | Heading
9972

(i)Services by the Central Government, State Government, Union
territory or local authority to governmental authority or
government entity, by way of lease of land.

Nil -

and sub-item (c) of item (Vi)

notification.

(i) Supply of land or undivided share of land by way of lease or
sub lease where such supply is a part of composite supply of
construction of flats etc. specified in the entry in column (3)
against serial number 3, at item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c),
sub-item (d), sub-item (da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-
item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v);

Provided that nothing contained in this entry shall
apply to an amount charged for such lease and sub-lease in
excess of one third of the total amount charged for the said
composite supply. Total amount shall have the same meaning for
the purpose of this proviso as given in paragraph 2 of this

Nil -

(iii) Real estate services other than (i) and (ii) above. 18 -7

against serial number 17, for item (vii) in column (3), and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5),

the following shall be substituted, namely: -

3) “) &)
“(vii) Time charter of vessels for Provided that credit of input tax
transport of goods. charged on goods (other than on
ships, vessels including bulk
5 carriers and tankers) has not been

taken
[Please refer to Explanation No.

(iv)].




28 THE GAZETTE

OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(viii) Leasing or rental services, with or | Same  rate of

without operator, other than (i), (ii), (iii), | integrated tax as

(iv), (v), (vi) and (vii) above. applicable on
supply of like
goods  involving
transfer of title in
goods.

® against serial number 23, against item (i) in column (3), in condition 1 in column (5), after the words “supplying
the service”, the words and brackets “, other than the input tax credit of input service in the same line of business

(i.e. tour operator service procured from another tour operator)” shall be inserted;

(g)  against serial number 23, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the

following shall be substituted, namely: -

3 @ &)

“(ii) Services by way of house-keeping, such as plumbing, Provided that credit of
carpentering, etc. where the person supplying such service through input tax charged on
electronic commerce operator is not liable for registration under | 5§ goods and services has
sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax not been taken

Act. 2017, [Please . refer . to

> Explanation No. (iv)].

(iii) Support services other than (i) and (ii) above. 18 -

(h) against serial number 24,-

(A) in the Explanation to item (i) in column (3), in clause (i), after sub-clause (g), the following sub-clause

shall be inserted, namely :-

“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(B) for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following

shall be substituted, namely: -

3) @ | ®
“(@i) Service of exploration, mining or drilling of petroleum crude or natural gas or 12 )
both.
(iii) Support services to mining, electricity, gas and water distribution other than (ii) 18 .
above. ’
@) for serial number 25 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
€)) (2) 3 “ 5
“25 | Heading (i) Services by way of house-keeping, such as Provided that credit
9987 plumbing, carpentering, etc. where the person supplying of input tax charged
such service through electronic commerce operator is on goods and services
not liable for registration under sub-section (1) of | 5 has not been taken
section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, [Please refer to
2017 Explanation No.
iv)l.
(i) Maintenance, repair and installation (except 18 .
construction) services, other than (i) above. ’
Q) against serial number 26, in column (3),-

(A) initem (i), after sub-item (e), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -
“(ea) manufacture of leather goods or footwear falling under Chapter 42 or 64 in the First Schedule to the

Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51of 1975) respectively;”;



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 29

(B) for item (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

3) CORNG)

“(iii) Tailoring services. 5 -

(iv) Manufacturing services on physical inputs (goods) owned by others, other than (i),

(ia), (ii), (iia) and (iii) above. 18 o

(k)  for serial number 32 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

(€] 2 3 @ |G
“32 | Heading (i) Services by way of treatment of effluents by a Common
9994 Effluent Treatment Plant.

(ii) Sewage and waste collection, treatment and disposal and
other environmental protection services other than (i) above.

12 -

18 o

) against serial number 34, in column (3),

(A) for item (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

3) @ | ®
“(iii) Services by way of admission to amusement parks including theme parks, water
parks, joy rides, merry-go rounds, go-carting and ballet.

18 -

(iiia) Services by way of admission to entertainment events or access to amusement
facilities including exhibition of cinematograph films, casinos, race club, any 28 -7
sporting event such as Indian Premier League and the like.

(B) initem (vi), after the brackets and figures “(iii)”, the brackets and figures “(iiia),” shall be inserted;
(ii) for paragraph 2, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“2. In case of supply of service specified in column (3), in item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d), sub-item
(da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v); and sub-item
(c) of item (vi), against serial number 3 of the Table above, involving transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the
case may be, the value of such supply shall be equivalent to the total amount charged for such supply less the value of
transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be, and the value of such transfer of land or undivided
share of land, as the case may be, in such supply shall be deemed to be one third of the total amount charged for such

supply.
Explanation. —For the purposes of this paragraph, “total amount” means the sum total of,-

(a) consideration charged for aforesaid service; and

(b) amount charged for transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be including by way of
lease/sublease.”.

[F. No. 354/13/2018-TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:— The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 8/2017 -
Integrated Tax(Rate), dated the 28thJune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 683 (E), dated the 28th June, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No. 48/2017-Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 14th November, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1407(E), dated the 14th November, 2017.



30 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

=T
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018
4. 2/2018- THIFT ()

ar.&.[. 70(3).—HFa arer vd Farwe afafaam, 2017 (2017 &7 13) @it 910 6 A 3T 4T (1) F q8q
TEed ATRRAT T AN FId gU, Feg AL 39 91d § Q5 21d gU o UAT FAT SAfed § da9dq® g i aug &
farRTiYert & e U¥, UaeEnT, WRa aEr, e dares (Teea A i sfeeEEr /e 9/2017- whiEd #:7
(39), fa=i= 28 5, 2017 & av.a1.7. 684 (31) faATF 28 J7, 2017 F Tgd WA & TSI, AATLYTIT & AW-11, T
3, SU-GT (i) H warara fham = o, 7 7 o off fAeaforfea denas wdt g, 797 -

Id ATeET §, gl 7 -
(F) FH "1 3 F qu Fwaw (3) F T@AE H#, FwHr GiaE” qeat F AT AT AL [FAEwE” e’

e frar s,
(@) FH HEaT 3 T 399 Hatad FAtsAt F qearq Metaied 77 9t o yfeatedy fiv siqemfua G sro,
T~
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

w3 | AATTO9 | HIAYTT F eIq=wig 2437 F faviq Y d=TAT AT HiAenT | 7T =T
F AIouR 2439 F IaEta el W A o i o T
FF | gated T BRamserT F qreay ¥ Few 99, ST
ACRT AT O T & AT TATHA TTIERCOT AT AT
ITFersReor A7 AT T T € ST ATl /T U Haret v
HIET o s w7 IEq qgET g A oge v
AT o Fog | 25 gfaerd ¥ AT T 27 |

()  F" "= 10 & 984, Fiad (3) i ¥ATE #, 95 (@) F gearq, Feterfaa 7z # siqeamfog G s, 7o -

‘(=) eATOTER HEATT AT USHId ST AT RS Hed it i ATe SATIfd & H1eqH/ § &F ST aret Jar,
ST 3 UH ST 9% A1 Al g St Aot #4938, -

(i) oo & forar s Soeray wreafies T a% AT GHHeT T a9 (9087 F |reqq 9 7

(i) ToreET srgwTTea sTeaTia foreT areewH & U FE & = | foar FAreAwm g
(9) %W "@EAT 17 F "9, wiaq (3) fF J&G §, “UF T oqsal & v a7 A ai” oret i wiaearya
SITUATT;
() # =EaT 20 i 399 "gataq gt F vearq Feafotad 77 de T 6 gtafegi w1 sia.eareg B s,
79T -
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“0F | off 9965 | T ¥ fRud fardl weer Fefig w2 | g7 | TH wTafe § [Afga e oft ama
T AT & a1 Rua faeT v 0w 30 fRrqwa, 2018 ¥ a8 @y
FTIATH & FIT ATA HT TEEH Fe T B |
ATETH | & ST ATeAT AT
207 | o 9965 | WTEa  fRuq felY Feerm aefioid wom | g7 | TE wlafe & fAfga &g iy ama
¥ qed & arge foud Tt s o 30 fRrqwa, 2018 ¥ a8 @NL
AT F FIT AT & IEET F3d & T 2 |
ATETH | & ST ATeAT AT




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 31

(F) w" =T 23 & 984, Fad (3) ft 7ATE #, 95 (|@) F gearq, Feterfag 7z & siqefog B s, 76w -
“@r) T et safe w Crentda, searat ST FHETREAl F aiagd & fou HieT argd o fF uE detors
et w7 fofaa, srearaant ofiT FH=TRAT F qiagd @ qar YS9 FIar g1 S o6 e q@ #iv faer s
ATeA T TAT AT THFET T Kl FAT F ATTT T TUAT HATU TST9 FLAT &,

(") #0 "ear 30 F TR T 399 Hateq WAT® & Te=rq Aot w9 deqr T gieatei #v ofd:eamfua &

STTUITT, J9T: -
o 2 ) @ ®
“30% off 9971 =T | Fvx AYHTT T ATHIRH ST TISIHTSH F iaqvia qeveds & | 7 o
off 9991 FHATAT T TG YT T B F ATLTH & T&TF 6T
ST ATeAt A1 =T 3w Sty % form wrewfa & 7 Sftee
FraT FATT |

(ST) #w" wear 37 % 90, Hiaw (3) i qfoaf® #, wg (1) § ‘U909 g &l F €A UL G AT A5l Al
g forar sroam;

(A)  F\ e 37 3 399 "ated gfafeat % vearq Aeafafea ww d@er i wfafsat v saetia B s,
9T -

(1) () ©) (4) (5)

“37% | ofiT 9971 a1 ofr¥ | sFw wiweaT 36 AT 37 | fAfafde T Frerst F 1= €T I
9991 W%W&Wﬁﬁﬁﬁwm

(1) | HEAT 40 S 3HY gataa wfafeai F wesnq, Amfetaa w0 g s vty wiv sfaenfia B s,
7T -

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“40% | 9971 | TRt =g Fam arer fRaw anfds oiw & Rua ffw fars & | o= o
ATeae SAHT Seraad wrEAREe Ataas Hed (ASTRUHE)
T BT, F T 9d & arge Ruq Gl arge i s
e Tramer & forw wredts waw & foe ot s o & & 1

Bl
T - 39 TEATY F 329 & forw, emuwuay ¥ ey
AT F ATETET F i T =R A g,

(i) & A g 7 =9 Afvaa sewta 31 arear & g av
T st 9 =0 e semta < g 97 S e uwueaE
& Ttz & foro fgea #i AfFams & % =7 4 aregar 6 g,
aT

(i) o Freft wer ydgw (o O d@r =)
BfeaTastt, 2015 ¥ siavia qa F 9127 F F [Aardr =
HAT I47 21, AT

(i) s FF wdr Smr QFEms g G e




32 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(EFrarTedT At a1 ) F fRun-fAge, 2015 F eaeiq
A THUHET AT ATARTT F w7 § dstisnad gr, a7
(iv) & et sfagfa va e =, (&) F s st

e At e (s, e qar ) fRer-fAda, 2015
F siquq =9 A AT & fi ar |

() % HEAT 47 % TH, Fiaw (3) T yf=At® § -
i. WE (F), 3T AL (ii) F TeaTq, FeAferiad 3T A & sfd e BT ST, T9T-
“(iii) v FLRTT, TT TLHRTL, T 1T &0, T 1T TTART0T, LT qriers<or a1 g fAarg;”;
i. W= (@), IT AL (jii) F 79T, FEiET 3T 7S A AT AT ST, TA_T -
“(iv) Fvg TLHRTT, LT TLHTL, T LT &, TATAT TTTEHT0T, FLRTLT TTTERe0T AT TR 7T

iii. WF (1), 37 WL (i) F weATq, FeAforfET 3T A F s EAviUT BT SO, 7om-
“(iii) v LT, LT TLHRTL, T 1T &3, T TTARTOT, FLhT<l ITierseor a1 qaa =g 17

(3) F\ HEAT 56 30T 399 "ated gfafeat & vearq Aeafatea ww d@ear i wfafsat @i saetia B s,
7T -

(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
56 | off 9985 | FIT ITUTET F IATETSEl | AT F WILAH & & STH ATl Jard I =T

(T) #w HEAT 57 & 984, Faw (3) it A4S ¥ 72 (), F TeA1q Mt 98 #iv siaearfoa B s, 7o1m-
“(ST) FT ITUTET o FALETSHT | gHF F ATEAT § & ST aTedl Jary |

(F) % HEAT 63 F THA, Fiew (3) T qfAT® § sz “Faer waArerw,” &1 fAefaa B srosm, zram:

(W) FH HEAT 68 Y IHY Hatda yATSAT F Tearq Meatotad 7 §e T i gttt wi sia.earea B s,
7T -

(1) () (©) (4) (5)

“68% | o 9991 | F==T T srfderTe srfarfaaw, 2005 (2005 T 22) * sfaia €TT | =7
SITARTY T&TH F27 3 ATLTH F < ST aret J=y |

(A) % HEAT 69 F THE, Fiow (3) T yfAT® F -
i WE (F) F wearq, Auafetea g @ sfaetia BT s, =r-
“(eF) ToRelT SreafoTen et T YA 9ok F ®T H IAwer & Tasl § YA THAT T AT Hh af ST
qTeAY FaT;”
i. TE@) -
(F) IT-AF (4) ¥, “ AT AT T aF” oreat A AefEa G ST,
(@) 379 (iv), % Tearq, et 3o ag & siaeanfog B s, 7om-
“(v) TSRS SteteR AT fiaTRwen it st v srgfd % Aveaw 7 Gl Sreafore deam w2




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 33

() UgFE H, 95T, FITSH T AT “TATS (@)’ F T T 957, FHCSH A AL “AF (F)” F “IT AL (i), (i)
A (jii) ” 1 wfeeTioq BT s,
(%) ae=qF & weaTq Mo wwegs v siq et T o, F9m-
“Ford o o fF w7 (@) F 37 A (v) § [T F2 Fft 919 UH deadi w An qgl g S & - (i)
e O foveT s S==ae wreatu Ta¥ o AT THHET T q (90T % qreq | F =47 (i) el st
ST fOreAT qTeene % Ua (e % =0 # forar & wreaw & srq+t 4970 ¥ W 21
() %W gear 80 & THe, wiwd (3) Fit wEATS #, 7 (1) § “UT gAY Meal F T YT “HIA g T+ 61" 9Ieal &l
gfareaoa e s, T9m:-
(3) %W HEAT 84 % THA, Fiew (3) it Gt F v wx FMwferfaa wf=fe #r wiawentua B sroa, om:-
“fReferfara o yaer 3 AT=Te F = & & S 9reAl F4T10

(F) T, T A7 TAuer-d= oew ares a7 gor ot arfe g;

(T) TERT TATIE, T FARE o e gfaerfar, i yedw a1 #r¢ izt 5 & arerar s =T
TATRIE F 9+ 2T;

(3T) WTEAT TS ST HEIUE;

() qTETHE,

STET ITAFT 7T (F), (@), (1) IT (F) § 797 AT THTIG JT TITA0 H T 5 AT 7 Ffawer 500 F0 sfr
=T F ATe T g1

[T, &.354/13/2018 -]
= fase, s af==

qE :— T ATAG=AT F=AT 12/2017- THFad F (37), 7% 28 5, 2017 F1 41.#1.77 684 (a1), far+ 28 5,
2017 & T&T I o TSI, FHTLTIO, % AW- 11, T2-3, IT-T< (i) § TR o o o7 i o sifaw
T ATIHLAAT FEAT 49/2017- THIFT F:2 (IX) fadqT® 14 Fawaw, 2017 & ar#r.f 1408 (31) fa==w 14

Farg, 2017 F T AT F TSI, AT, F AR-11, Te-3, IT-w< (i) § Tahriora & T o, F g
Tenrya R T |

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 2/2018- Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.70(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 6 of the Integrated Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (13 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest
so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of
the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue) No0.9/2017- Integrated Tax (Rate), dated
the 28th June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number
G.S.R. 684 (E), dated the 28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the
words ““ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -



34 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(@) @ (€) “ S

“3A Chapter 99 | Composite supply of goods and services in which the value of Nil Nil”;
supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent of the value
of the said composite supply provided to the Central Government,
State Government or Union territory or local authority or a
Governmental authority or a Government Entity by way of any
activity in relation to any function entrusted to a Panchayat under
article 243G of the Constitution or in relation to any function
entrusted to a Municipality under article 243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 10, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely: -

“(ba) way of supply of online educational journals or periodicals to an educational institution other than
an institution providing services by way of-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course;”;

(d) against serial number 17, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three years”
shall be substituted;

(e) after serial number 20 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

€)) (©) 3 “ (&)
“20A | Heading 9965 Services by way of transportation of goods | Nil Nothing contained in this
by an aircraft from customs station of serial number shall apply
clearance in India to a place outside India. after the 30th day of
September 2018.
20B | Heading 9965 Services by way of transportation of goods | Nil Nothing contained in this
by a vessel from customs station of serial number shall apply after
clearance in India to a place outside India. ;8?%‘}?3’ of September

(f) against serial number 23, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely: -

“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of
transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of
pre-school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”

(g) after serial number 30 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

M @) 3 ) (5)
“30A | Heading 9971 or Heading | Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be | Nil Nil”;
9991 provided by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the

personnel of Coast Guard under the Group Insurance
Schemes of the Central Government.

(h) against serial number 37, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;

(i) after serial number 37 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -



[ 9T [I-8vE 3(i)] YR T TSI : STHTHROT 35

1 ) 3 “ &)

“37A | Heading 9971 or Heading 9991 | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil Nil”;
specified in serial numbers 36 or 37.

(j) after serial number 40 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted namely: -

(1) (2) 3) 4) ©)

“40A Heading 9971 | Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a multi | Nil Nil”;
services SEZ with International Financial Services Centre (IFSC)
status to a customer located outside India for international
financial services in currencies other than Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary of
financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the Government of
India or any Regulator appointed for regulation of IFSC; or

(i) who is treated as a person resident outside India under
regulation 3 of the Foreign Exchange Management (International
Financial Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and
Development Authority of India (International Financial Service
Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office; or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange Board of
India (SEBI) under the Securities and Exchange Board of India
(International Financial Services Centres) Guidelines, 2015.

(k) against serial number 47, in the entry in column (3),-
(i) in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity;”;
(ii) in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity;”;
(iii) in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental
Authority or Government Entity.”;
(1) after serial number 56 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

@ @ 3 “ )

“56A Heading 9985 | Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce. Nil Nil”;

(m) against serial number 57, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce;”;

(n) against serial number 63, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,” shall
be omitted;

(o) after serial number 68 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

€)) 2 3) “ (6)

“68A Heading 9991 | Services by way of providing information under the Right to | Nil Nil”;
Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).




36 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(p) against serial number 69, in the entry in column (3),-
(i) after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee;”;

(i) in item (b),-

1. in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

2. after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals;”;

3. in the proviso, for the words brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letters “sub-items (i),
(i1) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;
4. after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;
(q) against serial number 80, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;
(r) against serial number 84, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -
“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised
sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)
above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note : The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 9/2017 -
Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 28thJune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 684 (E), dated the 28thJune, 2017 and was
last amended by notification N0.49/2017 — Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 14th November, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1408(E), dated the 14th November, 2017.

=T
7% faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

EqT 3/2018- THIFT X (3R)
&R 71(3).—FT T, ThEd 6T 7 T4 w7 srfafaam, 2017 (2017 #1 13) & ey 5 i 37U
(3) BT wacq ArfFadt T YA F2d gU, Ty it e 9%, vqagnr awa g, o @eres (T o) #i
Ffea=AT 9. 10/2017-UHrpa #7 (%) faar® 28 7, 2017, ™ ar.#1.4. 685(3) fawi® 28 7, 2017 97a *
TSI, STHTLTI o AT 11, @ 3, SUae (i) § werriord Foham am a7, § At gemed wedt g, a9m:-



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 37

I ATHEAT H, -
0) el #, w9 TEAT 6 7 39y "atad wfafeat & geurq, Metafa w0 d@er siw sug gatea gttt i
s e T STTosm, Tem-

(1) (2) (3) (4)

“6F | ¥ W v Far 77 afdfm, 2017 (2017 # | ¥ex weAT, Tew | FAd WE U fET W
12) % ST US(iha (] =a(<h T =T HU HT | qLHE, HT T afafaaw, 2017 % & wfed
BT Y 3T Feg YT, 9T WA, H e | 9 AT e | TREA W ud &Ar A7
871 AT T ST ¥ g A ST v e | | AT afarfe, 2017 # &7 20 %
T (v), ¥ Sfaeta wofga s
=7f<F |

(i)  TTCEET H, 3T AT (2.) F TeATq ATt ware v st R sus, e
‘(=) Toreft T stfSrawat” a1 srfermar st g S gaeh forw st srfafaaw, 1938 (1938 &1 4) #T a=1 2 %
IqaTET (10) ® far @ g v
[%7. §.354/13/2018- Sarea]

= faee, s af==

AT :— T ATAGHAT HT ATAGAAT Ho 10/2017- THIFA 2 (37), &A1 28 [ 2017, @ToFHTo o 685 (31), fadi=
28 S 2017 % T AT % TSI, ST, § FHTIAT FFham 72w w2r o7 =7 =ad sifaw a1e srfgrg=m Ho
34/2017- THiFa ¥ (37), fadi® 13 srFgaw, 2017, AroFTofAo 1277 (31) f3wiF 13 sr#Fgaw, 2017 & qgq
Terree et T ol

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 3/2018- Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 71(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 5 of the Integrated Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (13 of 2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the
following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of
Revenue), No.10/2017- Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the ZSthune, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 685(E), dated the 28"June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, -

(i) in the Table, after serial number 6 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and the entries
relating thereto shall be inserted, namely: -

ey @ 3 C))

“6A Services supplied by the Central Government, State Government, | Central Any person
Union territory or local authority by way of renting of immovable | Government, registered  under
property to a person registered under the Central Goods and | State the Central Goods
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017). Government, and Services Tax

Union territory | Act, 2017 read

or local | with clause (v) of

authority section 20  of
Integrated Goods
and Services Tax
Act, 2017.7;




38 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) in the Explanation, after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(f) “insurance agent” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (10) of section 2 of the Insurance
Act, 1938 (4 of 1938).".

[F. No. 354/13/2018- TRU]

RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note : The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 10/2017 -
Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 28th June, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 685 (E), dated the 28thJune, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No. 34/2017 - Integrated Tax (Rate), dated the 13th October, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1277 (E), dated the 13th October, 2017.

=T
7% faeett, 25 S9aTT, 2018

4. 4/2018- THiFT I ()

ar.#.[. 72(a1.).— THFT AT vE "Ar w7 AfAAIw, 2017 (2017 FT 13) A 9T 20 F ATT I5T Feai T
AT UE FATH Aterf==d, 2017 (2017 F7 12) H¥ &T=T 148 F TEq Tad ARAT HT TN Fd gU, Fvg ALY, THUF T
formrfert & senv wv, UShaa st i fMeaferfa sfor @ svafa -

(%) T uSiga =afe o7 & Gt Saome, faeew, fRafor st = s F osfiga =afe v G sfows &
uaS #, Qo AT sfer:, TRET e, fates T ar fMwtor dv=mt % oo et g6t F w1 # G F
AT 1 39 §; 3T
(@) TH UsiEa sAtw S AT T F i #7739 e # E wiowe F uasr |, quias 3T sferd:
fashTe o ATEh1E % iAo & &7 § TRl wreqersd, waw a1 fwtor gv==r & [ f & fir srghd
A 2,
T U Ushighd sARaT & &7 § A =d Fdl g o Aol § ITdad SUaTa (F) § daf9q i &ar F =7 § 9rea
TIIe 9% 3iiY SUdad IUATET (@) § gaf9a e & afese & &9 § wreq Ifawd U2, SFq 94T 6 AL 9% Ui
FT F A H ITAA I FHT TIT O T IFq caeue, foeew Ar Fwior Fudr, s off Rafa g, tw A

FIFAF, A= a7 @i Favor w1 % ey a1 sferee #7 siqeor 39 =9t &7 Fwar g e f Gl siaoor e o
THT T & e Tt forere (S T3 areies o=7) o geanets e sia g #var g |

[T T, 354/13/2018-Erame]

=t e, saw |fea

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 4/2018-Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.72(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 20 of Integrated Goods and Services Tax Act,
2017 (13 of 2017) read with section 148 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central
Government, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby notifies the following classes of registered persons,
namely:-

(a) registered persons who supply development rights to a developer, builder, construction company or any other
registered person against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of construction service of complex,
building or civil structure; and

(b) registered persons who supply construction service of complex, building or civil structure to supplier of
development rights against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of transfer of development rights,



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 39

as the registered persons in whose case the liability to pay integrated tax on supply of the said services, on the
consideration received in the form of construction service referred to in clause (a) above and in the form of development
rights referred to in clause (b) above, shall arise at the time when the said developer, builder, construction company or
any other registered person, as the case may be, transfers possession or the right in the constructed complex, building or
civil structure, to the person supplying the development rights by entering into a conveyance deed or similar instrument
(for example allotment letter).

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

FfgET
7% el 25 SaeY, 2018

T&qr 5/2018- THFa #X (W)

AL.FLRA.73(H.).— THiFa 71 vF Farhe sfataaw, 2017 (2017 =7 13) it &mer 6 it 3T &1 (1)
* TEd Tacq TRl T TANT Fd gU, Fex GYaTE, 38 970 § HqCE gid gU 1o UAT FHIAT SHied | 9T g
ST afvuE T [RRTell % e Y, Tqaanl, Fod GSIiord AT TTHidE 19 T 1 & A7a0 IT G 6
T ATE AT TET ST AT SATH ATAT HaTaAl it qT TAT A T THFHT F H I8 28 T g2 adl g o
T3 T T WiThe T2iorad § Fvg T3 & (96, Tl A § Feg TR G FhT 0 Sraer § 77
g, F €7 § Frg T F1 AW 50 S arer Iawwe 9% JEIAm Sar ¢ |

[T, §. 354/13/2018- fran'{‘{]
= face, s ===

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 5/2018- Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 73(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 6 of the Integrated Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (13 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest
so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby exempts the inter-State supply of services by way of grant of
license or lease to explore or mine petroleum crude or natural gas or both, from so much of the integrated tax as is
leviable on the consideration paid to the Central Government in the form of Central Government’s share of profit
petroleum as defined in the contract entered into by the Central Government in this behalf.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

i@
% fawett, 25 sTadt 2018

¥, 6/2018- ThiFd X ()

ALHLFA.74(F.).—ofFa 71 va Farae afafamm, 2017 (2017 #1 13), vafens qe=rq S 3#q srfafaa &
Tafa T T €, i 977 6 FT IT 91T (1) F T2 Tacd ARAT FT AN F4d g4 hex AL, 39 a7 | Sq5€ 2Id g0
& UHT FAT SAfEd § araewE g oY uhiug #7 FRrerfen F arenw u¥, Uagny 39 Harsh H argia uw, oA arara
T % -8 | T 79 21 ofiw S 39 srferfaerg & amer 20 F g 9 60 U e arer ue qEre afatha,
2017 (2017 &7 12) &t ST |1 % #g 5 % 3T 0L () & Siaq9id ot g, U S Afaf==e ¥ emar 7 % a7 9fsq e 5



40 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

& AT T ST ATl TohTohd 7 8 39 g8 a6 g2 <dl g (o g8 ah I 9% HAT (e oAt (AT qTeT T Jo
fRrateor) Mammaet, 2007 & =9 10 F 37 =9 (1) F 37 a1 (1) F v 797 GFfAfETe deragr o7 o oo«
LAl AT AT ok & dae § HAT 9o A=, 1962 (1962 F1 52) FT amer 14 Fit 3T & (1) F fasia =iiva
39 yiawer uw, o aw i e @ur s wam G @ g, $imr gqen 2R sfatqem, 1975 (1975 &1 51) #
1T 3 &T IT YT (7) F AT Tohed HTHT Lok TAT STTAT 2f |

[T T, 354/13/2018-Frarr7]
=i fase, s qf==

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 6/2018- Integrated Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.74(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 6 of the Integrated Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (13 of 2017), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, the Central Government, on being satisfied
that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby exempts the integrated
tax leviable under section 5 read with section 7 of the said Act on the supply of services, imported into the territory of
India, covered by sub-item (c) of item 5 of Schedule II to the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017) as
made applicable by section 20 of the said Act, to the extent of the aggregate of the duties of Customs leviable under
sub-section (7) of section 3 of the Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51 of 1975), on the consideration declared under sub-
section (1) of section 14 of the Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962) towards royalties and license fees included in the
transaction value as specified under clause (c) of sub-rule(1) of rule 10 of the Customs Valuation (Determination of
Value of Imported Goods) Rules, 2007 on which the appropriate duties of Customs have been paid.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

FrfEeT
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

€. 1/2018- §9 TI&T #< (TT)

qr. &M, 75(31). —F<T A1er ve GErae sfataay, 2017 (2017 & 12) F¥ 4w 15 F 37T (5) 997 97 16
£ ITUTT (1) F AT qTSq T TSAAT AT T 4T < ATA77, 2017 (2017 F7 14) ¥ €127 7 67 37 9727 (1), 727 8
#T IT GTT (1), TAT gRT 21 F G (iv), TF @ (v) § TIqaq RTT A1 TI0T Fd g0, Feg aehTe, aieug i it
T U A AUAHT 217 T UHT FAT A Fa H T 9d ", fAqa gaArery (Trsea @) i srfergEen
AT 11/2017 &9 78T F7 (37) faaiw 28 7, 2017 S % 9 % o=, @, @€ 1, 90 3, 3T A7 (i) &
T, "@AT 702 (1), 37T 28 57, 2017 T THTAT g 7, H FHT dera FdT § T9T-

T ATEAT §, FTeoft F -

(F) FY TE&AT 3 F 90, wied (3) H, -
F. 7% (iv) H,
@) IT 9T () F w1 9 Aremterfaa & wioeetoa BT sro, 7om-

“(m) =eft 3 forw srame (org ) frem/seams w5t e T (9gdt) F siasta W T U G9ree & w7
H TIRT Fd U AAH A Jeqdl T T FATHE (A G0,



[ I-ETE 3(i)]

RA h1 ASUA : STHIYRO 41

(ii)

(iii)

IT 0T () F oAt Aeferfaa 3w wal #r sfa-earioa B S, 769m-

“(aF) #rE fAmior se=mT 37 s g gt fwtor e S 5 a9y 3 e srare (orgdh) frem/mar w5t
ATETH ATSTAT (TgLT) F A Toq/FH T /EAT T Irfaraweor/argdt faeme arfarseor & gy anfiar
F Tgd UhISTd IS & dgd s9d &7 F FASIL a1 & forg [T srare & gefaq 2r;

(=) F1 Fator G a1 oo wr gor At st o & a9t % oo e (awd) Remysar w=h
ATETH ATSAT (L) F AT ATTF =T F FHSNT FM (STee 0/ T T/ (TAASST)/HETHT AT
-1 (THATES-1)/AETH T -2 (THATES1-2) T Helfaq wiez foish feast = F oiaqsia Al a7
Fferfaa aeTet & "ated g7,

IT WE () F qoATq (Aeferferd 30 78t & siq-wiud B o, 7=1m;-

“(=) TET waq S o U Rl R % wartae ® g1 S s sfafeem, 1961 (1961 & 43) F
AT ISIiHd gl, SEET TN Feg GIH, TS YR, §9 ST &7 AT T ATIFON % F0
TSI TeATER WIS TS & St AT IS 1 T Fed, Feald & F JATC FLT AT IART

oo e % wrd § T Srar En,

g, e (v) §,

) IT AL (F) | “TISHL 958 F LT UL “THT” 978 (1 Tfqeamioa fZar Srosm,
(i) IT W4T () F oAt FAeferfad 3w 7 t #r staearfog B s,
“(ar) Forelt e aer R TR F sanTd ST U HEd g fSreeRt wrde UhEr 60 & Wi

afa #e &1 e aa qvw, b wares, snfde araer F fFamr & osrfegeEr, wreed g

13/6/2009-ar2uu, faeis 30 6T+, 2017 F qgd AGHLAAT 6T IoAT (34T T4T 8157
T e (ix) 3T S99 Hatea TaeaAt, Fey (3), (4) 3% (5) H, F v u¥ Fetertaa 1 siawarfua

STURTT, TAT:-
(3) (4) (5)
“(ix) FET AT T "ETHRT Atafaw, 2017 &
g 2 F et (119) # Fegfearioa fAwfer Ford T STt UHT Faro Rt " A i
qEy A HgET arqld, S o GR ST S TET T ST TR B, gl ST I (AT g1
FTT AT BHATE A AT TS 21 S O 3w (i) av 6 qq I (AHTor T F wHarer | v ¥ T gr SAr
vi) § RRfEE @ b — 3 STaT Fvg HERTT, ToT 4RI, 9 T &8
T, HF ST AT R e s A ﬁFWW-ﬁ%ﬁ&ﬁ@%m
T St a7 Rt g fE i vEe T AT 2
FAT 2T |
Frarg F HETHRY taeEd, 2017 &
25 e (149 % v 7 B sret et Pt aweardy e A
. . (119) ST T ST TE B, a8 SRl 3% AT g
g A S i, o % fe o s A 79 Rt 4 s i s £ o A
BT qeA SHATT AT AT TE 2T S T g (vii) 7 25 % ST Feg AT, TS O, HY ST 87
fafafec gare = Fvg OTHY, TST GLEL, 99 o Tl SR, S oft Rurf 2 ¥ g
=g AT TR T owifeeRwr A " =T T A |
TferReor a7 Rt I AT 7 ST Fear gr




42

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(@)

(M

(=)

(xi) =¥ T T@AT F T F <7 AT ATAT TATT S
o watew, swufdr sgr & soaetfher a e

ATYET 3 AR T U FATH AT TIA AT AT | 95 | HSE A AL |

=ik & o FhT arer ud el afafaam fi
GTT 22 T 3T &7 (1) F i o 10T a9TH

THE

[FIAT TSRO |6 (iv) 3]

Ford o AT UE FATeA 9¥ AT TAE <o i

(xii) Frmfor Fam < £ 3w (1), (i), (iil), (iv),
(v), (vi), (vii), (viii),(ix), (x) 37 (xi) & Forer 2 |

FH T 9 F qHe, Hiaw (3) Fr G&AE H, 7w (v) H “UTHfdw d97 q51l F T T UTHAE 9, FoAl
Terferay, Hiex Rafe (R amm T2 & 918 F STE1 79T ), 218 wfite S9er a1 Ui gars v gat

7 giaeerioq B ST |

F GeaT 10 F 99, Hied (3) T A= (ii) 3 T 9 TAT Fem (3), (4) 7 (5) H 399 "atq qfAtedl F e

77 A ferfaa =1 sfaeenfug G SToem, 7em-

() (4) (%)

“(ii) ATl FT qRERT T AT FTAATAT FT

TEH AT

2.5

[T TSR HEAT (iv) 3]

Ford % A1 (SR, Sera, e o
FER o SR AT 9T 2, ¥ Uue) W
qrive gAqe F AT B 7 ot W A

(iii) ofEgs argat & AT ATAF T FAAT
3T =T 3 e w= 3 A &, s () |9

T (i) & o |

FH TEAT 16 ¥ I FAAd A tegT & v 2 fAeterterd 1 yiaearfoa & sosm, 7=7m:-

(1) )

3)

(4)

®)

“16 | ofiT 9972

(i) gfr #r 9z T fRU A9 F GTeAT ¥ Feg aa, 5T G,
T TS AT T JTIER0T o g7 et gt wrfaraeor a7
et aw=ry A 7 < ST Aol 94Ty |

LA

(il) T AT IT TZ F SAreme 9 AT {0 AT Gfw = ettt fer
#T g stet o U oI wE (i); 799 (iv) F 3T 9% (W), 3T 6%
(M), 3T AT (F), IT HE (TF) AT 3T A (I@); HL (v) F 3T 9%
(@), 3T AT (), 3T AZ (F) ¥ IT 7L () U 9% (vi) F IT AL
(M) # w7 "5edaT 3 F g9 qar® F wiag (3) ¥ AAEe wer
e = fAmTor it wFa argfd w1 uE e g

Ford f == wfaf® & AT #r fF arq t7 9 =7 3v-
T qT ATRA 39 T i o A 99 gnh | B SF 9y
AT a¥ AT T A F UF fagrs | afeT g | 37 wweqE &
el e i & afavm FE gRm ST oTees ooz
AT o s 2 § AT =T E

5l

(iif) SR (i) AT (if) 7 TorF LU TEEE HATY




[9r II-'vg 3(i)] R k1 TSI : STHTER 43

(®)

FH HEAT 17 F geT FHiq qear (3) ¥ 7 (vii) F T 9T 97 Faw (3), (4) @ (5) T & T 39 "Hafdd
gtafe=t % v yv fferfea s sfaeertia BT s, o -

&) (4) ®)

“(vii) |1 T qTREET FEA AT ST Ford fF TH W (ST R S,
T 2T2H ATET steraT, o aew FREe 6w
25 ff oy & F T AT A OgUE)
TAYE &R AT wfee 7 ot T

[T TTCERET HEAT (iv) 3E]

(viil) TET AT BT it AT AT ey | 99 TSAET w7

afa & A, S B (), (i), | o e

(i), (iv), (v), (vi) ST (vii) T g6 | S

sy +ft o 2,
A argfd o A
gl

FH AT 23 F 90 o1 1 ¥, FiAH (3) f W& (i) ¥ GGt Fraw (5) i wiafe §, “Farefi # g, oeai
TIAT “, T WAT o =TT (S T et s 22 aravew 3 <ft 1€ 22 sravew Ja) § e F4ansh & e
wiee § fore” 1 eiqeafog B s

F TEAT 23 F AU i’ (3) F T (i) F T UL TIAT ST AT HwAA (3), (4) ;2 (5) F wfafeat F waw
7= fAferfea w1 wfaeanfua frar sroam, ae-

©) (4) ®)

“(il) =T #Y FEaTr F w7 F & 0 At Far S¥ B i, Ford T wrer we Harr
FICUTT STl foh STl e THE STI¥ET % AIEaW 8 UHT qarat T TR 3 A
T T FTA AT FIRF F T Fedr wrer v A Ay Ay | 25 | Ao A AT
oTeT 22 ¥ I 9TRT (1) 3 ST TS SAeAT AE E | [T FqCET e
(iv) %]

(iii)) TR FATO S 3w (i) SR (i) & e g 9

F HEAT 24 F TR FH (3),-

(i) % 7 (i) ¥ vt § faw 7o srcdawor #, SuarF () § I ITATHT (V) F ToATq ArtrfEd s #7 o
ToTiua o STTosT, T -

“(ST) FTT ITUTET o FFT GT3Al H AT & HeqH & & AT ATt ar;”;

(i) F 92 (i) F 9 IT 9T I99 AT FAT (3), (4) AT (5) v yfFtAt F vy w FAetafaa w
gfeesTia forar sosm, -

3) 4) | (9

“(ii) Foor TSI /AT YT T8 F AT, T IT ST T &aT 6

(iii) ==, A, i Sfe Ster Sterawor it Tgrae Fard S 5 3wed (i) & foae g 9




44 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(=) F HEAT 25 AT 399 qefq wfafeat F v w2 Retorfeaa v wfoeetoa o stro, =em-
(1) ) 3) (4) (5)

“25 | o (i) 7% Y TEarer F = F & O qren Jare 5w Fort T wrer et
gog7  ACEL s sai f et e e :g;‘”ﬁ"%q
Ty | UHT A1 U IS FLA AT SA<E F T 25 | Hrasar
FeT AT T AATHRT FTATTT it o=y 22 7 IT 9= |
(1) % AT TSI ATTITF T2 3 | [FoaT TSRO
HEAT (iv) 3]

(i) F@NTA, AOAT A qeqmqe garu (Rt w3 #:

BIEHT), STAF (i) 7 9T |

() FY TEAT 26 F e Hiaw (3) H,-
a. WT (i) 3T AT (T.) F TATq (AT 3T A HT FqFATHAT AT STUR, 7T -
“(=.%) T g R srferfaa, 1975 (1975 &1 51) it TIH SATAT & AT 42 AT 64 § AT AT FHHAM:

THE F HTATET A1 Fefaaw F fEafawtr;
b. W= (iii) F T 9T T IEE WA (3), (4) AT (5) Fr wfAfPAt F rorw wx fAeterfaa = wiawenfuq
[ERISIEUIADRIHE
®3) @) | 6
“(iil) et e 25

(iv) T F T | AT ATl SiTa® aeqalt (A & et i aar, 3=+ (i),
(i), (ii), (iiwR) 3 (iii) & fo= |

(@) W TEAT 32 ¥ 399 gefdd vttt F v uw et i siaeafa S s, em-

(1) 2 3) 4) | (9
“3p | o (i) FIT SHAE veTte ¥ FIRT IS 3 wiene i Far 6

9994 (ii) TorasT 3T =T T Tahot, ITRT TILITET 3 Aqer qo
qT qATAL A AT, ITFT (i) & foe

(®) FH GEAT 34 % a9, FaH (3),

a. me (i) % T 9 99T 399 Heidq waw (3), (4) # (5) H yfFrRAt F o wr fAwtofaa
StaeaTiaa T ST, 7o -



[ 9T [I-8vE 3(i)] YR T TSI : STHTHROT 45

(3) ) | (5
“(iii) TSI aTeRt o oftw U, Are uTee, S TEed, 8 Tsed, M-
LT fF T & i 97 § w397 & 9 § & S ATelt 7447 |
(iiiT) TS FHIE H v AT AARSE giagrsh, e Reaenms e v
TR, HTEAT, T e e hieT guig oF 6 g e A sfr oo g eiie | 14 | -
THT 9g % 3T 914 AT &, F JA90 F ®T § &F S ATeqt 9447 |

b. &= (vi) ¥, FhIts 3T 30k “(iii)” F AT FIcsH AL 3FF “(jii=F),” FT o &ATOT AT ST,
(iil) LT 2 F w7 g fAeterfera v staeerfoa G srosm, 7e: -

“2. IUgEd ATV F FH 9T (3) F AL (i); WL (iv) F 3T AL (@), 3T 6L (), 3T 7L (F), IT AL (FF) f¥ IT AL (T9);
7T (v) F 3T HE (), IT AL (), ST AL (F) 3T 3T AL (FF); A< 72 (vi) F ST AL (1) F Fiew (3) ¥ fafafEee gar
& gt & e #, S w21 qfw % sfaarfora {er, s ot fufa gy, &1 staeor enfaer gr ar veft sl v
qed T FA T F FHIEA SIS (% Tl Arqf o i gor wio #§ & v qfv av v qfv F gt e,
St oft Rurf 21, % siawwr Yog it gere yred g S U sy 3 ar v 9y F afaarm Ren, S of Rufy
F AL G & forT g |TT STu R g Ut el aw aria ger wfer & uwh-fagrs grm
TTCE RO — ITGFT TIATE 2 o IS |, “FpeT T80 7 o -

(F) STFT AT F TAS § AT TIAH; T

(@) VT g F/A AT VAT G F srtarariorg BE F/AT, S oft Rafa gy, staewr 97 artia ey, e v saeor §
T AT 3T TST A TR B, F AN H B

[T, &. 354/13/2018- Framey)
= faee, s af=a

qe: o Afeg=ET A . "Ear 702 (31), 3 28 §9, 2017 F aga Ateg=ear /. 11/2017 — 9 T5q8T 77
(39), faT® 28 S, 2017 F T WG & TSI, AT H TR it T2 e a7, dear 1409(3),
3T 14 Fawae, 2017 F qgd AT HEAT 46/2017- TF AT 2 (IX) 3% 14 Fawa<, 2017 30T 697
sifare Fetrer o T am

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 1/2018-Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.75(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 7, subsection (1) of section 8
and clause (iv) and clause (v) of section 21 of the Union Territory Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (14 of 2017) read
with sub-section (5) of section 15 and sub-section (1) of section 16 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12
of 2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council, and on being satisfied that it is necessary in
the public interest so to do, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of
India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.11/2017- Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28" June,
2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 702(E),
dated the 28" June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification,



46 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) 1in the Table, -
(a) against serial number 3, in column (3), -
(A) in item (iv),-
I for sub-item (c), the following sub-item shall be substituted, namely: -

‘(c) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “In-situ redevelopment of existing slums using
land as a resource, under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);’;

(ID) after sub-item (d), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(da) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “Economically Weaker Section (EWS) houses”
constructed under the Affordable Housing in partnership by State or Union Territory or local authority or urban
development authority under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/ Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);

(db) a civil structure or any other original works pertaining to the “houses constructed or acquired under the
Credit Linked Subsidy Scheme for Economically Weaker Section (EWS)/ Lower Income Group (LIG)/ Middle
Income Group-1 (MIG-1)/ Middle Income Group-2 (MIG-2)” under the Housing for All (Urban) Mission/
Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana (Urban);’;

(IID) after sub-item (f), the following sub-items shall be inserted, namely: -

“(g) a building owned by an entity registered under section 12AA of the Income Tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961),
which is used for carrying out the activities of providing, centralised cooking or distribution, for mid-day meals
under the mid-day meal scheme sponsored by the Central Government, State Government, Union territory or
local authorities.”;
(B) in item (v),
@ in sub-item (a), for the word “excluding”, the word “including” shall be substituted,;

In after sub-item (d), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -

“(da) low-cost houses up to a carpet area of 60 square metres per house in an affordable housing project which has been
given infrastructure status vide notification of Government of India, in Ministry of Finance, Department of Economic
Affairs vide F. No. 13/6/2009-INF, dated the 30th March, 2017;”;

©) for item (ix) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -

3 “ (&)
“(ix) Composite supply of works contract as
defined in clause (119) of section 2 of the Central Provided that where the services are supplied to
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a a Government Entity, they should have been
sub-contractor to the main contractor providing 6 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (iii) or item (vi) above entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
to the Central Government, State Government, Government, Union territory or local authority,
Union territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.
Authority or a Government Entity.
(x) Composite supply of works contract as defined
in clause (119) of section 2 of the Central Goods Provided that where the services are supplied to
and Services Tax Act, 2017 provided by a sub- a Government Entity, they should have been
contractor to the main contractor providing 25 procured by the said entity in relation to a work
services specified in item (vii) above to the ’ entrusted to it by the Central Government, State
Central Government, State Government, Union Government, Union territory or local authority,
territory, a local authority, a Governmental as the case may be.
Authority or a Government Entity.
(xi) Services by way of house-keeping, such as
plumbl.ng, carpentering, €tc. where the person Provided that credit of input tax charged on
supplying such service through electronic .

. . . . 2.5 goods and services has not been taken

commerce operator is not liable for registration [Please refer to Explanation no. (iv)]
under sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central ’ ’
Goods and Services Tax Act
(xii) Construction services other than (i), (ii), (iii), 9 o
@iv), (v), (vi), (vii), (viii), (ix), (x) and (xi) above. ’




[9r II-'vg 3(i)] R k1 TSI : STHTER 47

(b) against serial number 9, in the entry in column (3), in item (v), for the words “natural gas”, the words and
brackets “natural gas, petroleum crude, motor spirit (commonly known as petrol), high speed diesel or aviation turbine
fuel” shall be substituted;

(c) against serial number 10, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5),
the following shall be substituted, namely: -

3) G)) &)
“(@i) Time charter of vessels for transport of Provided that credit of input tax charged on
goods. goods (other than on ships, vessels
2.5 including bulk carriers and tankers) has not
been taken

[Please refer to Explanation no. (iv)].

(iii) Rental services of transport vehicles with

or without operators, other than (i) and (ii) 9 -7
above.
(d) for serial number 16 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely: -
(€] 2 3) @ | O
“16 | Heading (i) Services by the Central Government, State Government,
9972 Union territory or local authority to governmental authority or | Nil -

government entity, by way of lease of land.

(i) Supply of land or undivided share of land by way of lease or
sub lease where such supply is a part of composite supply of
construction of flats, etc. specified in the entry in column (3),
against serial number 3, at item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c),
sub-item (d), sub-item (da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-
item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v);

and sub-item (c) of item (vi). Nil -
Provided that nothing contained in this entry shall apply to an
amount charged for such lease and sub-lease in excess of one
third of the total amount charged for the said composite supply.
Total amount shall have the same meaning for the purpose of this
proviso as given in paragraph 2 of this notification.
(iii) Real estate services other than (i) and (ii) above. 9 -7
(e) against serial number 17, for item (vii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5),
the following shall be substituted, namely: -
(3) 4) (5)
“(vil) Time charter of vessels for Provided that credit of input tax
transport of goods. charged on goods (other than on
ships, vessels including bulk
25 carriers and tankers) has not been
taken

[Please refer to Explanation no.

(iv)].

(viii) Leasing or rental services, with or | Same rate of Union
without operator, other than (i), (ii), (iii), | territory tax as
(iv), (v), (vi) and (vii) above. applicable on
supply of like -7
goods  involving
transfer of title in
goods.




48 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

® in serial number 23, against item (i) in column (3), in condition 1 in column (5), after the words “supplying the
service”, the words and brackets “, other than the input tax credit of input service in the same line of business (i.e. tour
operator service procured from another tour operator)” shall be inserted;

(2) against serial number 23, for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5),
the following shall be substituted, namely: -

A3) “ ®)
“(ii) Services by way of house-keeping, such as plumbing, Provided that credit of
carpentering, etc. where the person supplying such service through input tax charged on
electronic commerce operator is not liable for registration under goods and services has
sub-section (1) of section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax 2.5 | not been taken
Act, 2017. [Please refer to
Explanation no. (iv)].
(iii) Support services other than (i) and (ii) above. 9 -
(h) against serial number 24,-
(A) in the Explanation to item (i) in column (3), in clause (i), after sub-clause (g), the following sub-clause shall be

inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(B) for item (ii) in column (3) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be
substituted, namely: -

3) @ |G
“(ii) Service of exploration, mining or drilling of petroleum crude or natural gas or 6 )
both.
(iii) Support services to mining, electricity, gas and water distribution other than (ii) 9 s
above. ’
@) for serial number 25 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
M ) 3) @ 3)
“25 | Heading (i) Services by way of house-keeping, such as Provided that credit
9987 plumbing, carpentering, etc. where the person supplying of input tax charged
such service through electronic commerce operator is on goods and services
not liable for registration under sub-section (1) of 2.5 | has not been taken
section 22 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act,
[Please  refer to
2017. . .
Explanation no. (iv)].
(i) Maintenance, repair and installation (except 9 .
construction) services, other than (i) above. ’
Q) against serial number 26, in column (3),-
A. in item (i), after sub-item (e), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely: -

“(ea) manufacture of leather goods or footwear falling under Chapter 42 or 64 in the First Schedule to the Customs Tariff
Act, 1975 (51of 1975) respectively;”;

B. for item (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -



[9r II-'vg 3(i)] R k1 TSI : STHTER 49

(3) @ | &

“(iii) Tailoring services 2.5 -
(iv) Manufacturing services on physical inputs (goods) owned by others, other than (i), 9 .
(ia), (ii), (iia) and (iii) above. ’

(k) for serial number 32 and the entries relating thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

M @ 3) CONE®)

“32 | Heading (i)Services by way of treatment of effluents by a Common 6 )

9994 Effluent Treatment Plant.

(ii) Sewage and waste collection, treatment and disposal and 9 .
other environmental protection services other than (i) above.

) against serial number 34, in column (3),

(A) for item (iii) and the entries relating thereto in columns (3), (4) and (5), the following shall be substituted,
namely: -

3) @ | &

“(iii) Services by way of admission to amusement parks including theme parks, water 9
parks, joy rides, merry-go rounds, go-carting and ballet.

(iiia) Services by way of admission to entertainment events or access to amusement
facilities including exhibition of cinematograph films, casinos, race club, any 14 -7
sporting event such as Indian Premier League and the like.

(B) in item (vi), after the brackets and figures “(iii)”, the brackets and figures “(iiia),” shall be inserted;

(ii) for paragraph 2, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“2. In case of supply of service specified in column (3), in item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d), sub-item
(da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v); and sub-item
(c) of item (vi), against serial number 3 of the Table above, involving transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the
case may be, the value of such supply shall be equivalent to the total amount charged for such supply less the value of

transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be, and the value of such transfer of land or undivided share
of land, as the case may be, in such supply shall be deemed to be one third of the total amount charged for such supply.

Explanation. —For the purposes of this paragraph, “total amount” means the sum total of -
(a) consideration charged for aforesaid service; and

(b) amount charged for transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be including by way of
lease/sublease.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018-TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:— The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 11/2017 —
Union Territory Tax(Rate), dated the 28thJune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 702 (E), dated the 28th June, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No. 46/2017- Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 14th November, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1409(E), dated the 14th November, 2017.



50

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

qr.#1.f.76(3N).— = TwET A1 uF 4T Fw7 AfAtHEE, 2017 (2017 FT 14) v 4T 8 F ITUT (1)
* Tgd Y& Thdl &1 TANT Fd gU g T3h1Y, 39 a1d § §q2 2id gU % UAT HIAT SHed | Aa9@F ¢,
TRue & FERel 7Y, TaEel 9Rd 3R, A @A (TeeE T i ategEer |, 12/2017- 59
T T (3X) oA 28 57, 2017, ™ ar.anF. 703 (1), f&Fiw 28 7, 2017 % qEq AT & oI,

FfgET

7% faeeft, 25 sadt, 2018
. 2/2018- €9 TSTEH FX (IX)

ST, % W 11 % @< 3 ITE< (i) § WHTra Foha I o, § Aemferted serred wdl §, T -
I ATELAAT |, AV H -

(%)

FH HEAT 3 F HHET FHIAH (3) A TATE |, T ATHT” A&l o TIAT AT FLAHET (b ezt

T s :FTraa T S, -
(@) FH HEAT 3 37 3Ey gataa wiEAtet % geurq Reatafa w0 e siw gfafs=n #iv sqertoa
STTUSTT, 72T~
(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“dg | AT | GIAYT F Ao 2437 F Sq9d AT 9=TEd w AT | T s

99

Tiaem % aoes 2439 F favd et ae A @
aiy o oY w1 & gatea et ST F areaw
T Feg ALHTL, 5T GLHTT T 99 15T &0 AT 0T
TTERT0T AT TLHTET TTTARTOT IT ATy (9T T &%
ST ATeAT AT e ATl f S i (ores 71 it
ST T AYG AT oA THT A F GeT | 25

sferd & sfer 7 37 |
()  FY GEAT 16 F A9, Fiey (3) Ft IR F, “UF a0 9rsat F T X T AW oreai wr TiaEdTod
ERIES LT
() FH HET 19 3T AT Hargq qateAt F we=rq Metertaa w6 g9 o7 gfatedi #1 siaentua
[ERUSILCIARE IR
(1) (2) (3) “4) (5)
“og | o AaTea | fuq et Feew g | zawtate # fAfga # oft
9965 QQHWT;‘;T%Wﬁw%ﬁFW T 30 R, 2018 %
T ATLATA & FT AT 1 Tiaga :
e A A A T T Er
199 | o aa # Rug et feewm w7 | swyRflE A AR w i
9965 TEI & AT & drge feord freft worme FTa 30 forawae, 2018 =+
T FAAN F GRT WA A GEaed T8 AT Al BT |
T o HILAH | & ST qTeAT 74T

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 51

(¥) 9 H=AT 22 % 98, Fiad (3) fit gfAf2 #, w7 (@) F ge=rq, Aefotaa 7w v siqenfog G
STTUSTT, T: -
“(m) T TRt =teR iy fentea, srearaeRt siw seETREt % afvees F forw wqiew arga o & vw aefies
AT T =TT, AeaTaeht ST FHATAT 6 TET I HaT T&TF FLdT gl Sl 1o feramead q& =t forar
T AT TqC AT THher T it FAAT F ATEAT | G FAATT T&T FaT g 17

(F) FH FEAT 29 F FHE A IAH FATId TATE & qearq Meferied 7 §er 7 g fedi wr i@
ENECRERISILCIAREIHE

(1) (2) 3) (4) ®)

sogg | T g FLATL 6l AT ST ATSTATSN 6 FaiTd qeserd | T o=,
9971 9T | ® HHATILAT &l A9 TT TLATLH He & HILAH T &
ofres =T ST ATt AT T&F 60 ST o6 Fow Jgata &f 15
9991 Strae | F9T |

() FH GEAT 36 F AU, FHiAH (3) T TATS &, 7 (1) § “TATH AT 9Tal F £ATT UL “GT AT eTeal T

EIRERNECRERIIS ILSIF
() FH "eAT 36 T IHH HaTeq WATSAT F qearq At w7 H§edr T Tarsdi # s e
o ST, e -
(1) 2) 3) (4) ()

wagx | ofid FH |ear 35 A1 36 # fafAfde AT Frsmarsh F O 9T o7,
9971 7 | STHT F HIEAR F & W ATAT FATT |

ofir
9991

(7)) FH "EAT 39 Y a9 Hated vttt & geunq, Mwtetea w0 e siv gttt v sfaenfa
[ERISIUIADEIHS

(1) (2) (3) (4) ()

wags | offT Tl g Far ar Few s e § R e | = o=
9971 qarar % ATered At ferae wEAafdEe qiEas
He (AETHUTHT) T2d gl, F g 7 & aTg? foord
Frft wmeg #r stavrsdr e Jarett F forg T
&0 & Fore et o qar § & 1€ fe=rd

TICEHTOT o~ T TAT® F 3297 & forw, smsuwuadt §
e Traei F Areey ¥ sfv TR stE A, AT
(i) For& s gwe 7 =8 Afeed srafa ar wegar &
& a1 et Rt g & =v e saafa <
g AT S sEuwuEHT & At F o P # i




52 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

EIREIGEAE R R R e

(ii) Forar sl o werem (st At @4 F )
=T, 2015 F aq 9T F FET # A
et ==t~ w7 =T B, Ar

D EIRER SR I IREICRI e R e A BET|
(Frarsi o @& %) & feem-fager, 2015 &
ST ATSURTHHT AAT STfeeRTy % ®7 H usfha &,
qr

(iv) FE s wiosgfa va fBffm 9, @& ) F
A wfayfa va e 9 (s, BT
a7 wex) frem-fAder, 2015 & v z@ FAfea
AAATT T &l 2 |

(1) FF TEAT 45 % TR, Fwaw (3) f wfafe d -

i. 7 (F), ST 9% (i) F Te=ATq, Fetorfaa 3o 7w v siaearfua G s, Tom-

“(iii) g AT, T ALHTL, T ST &0, TITAT TTTERT0T, LRI TTTERT0r A7 HEahT e,
i % (@), 3T 9T (jii) F T9ATq, MeATIEd 3T 7 & ST A9 HAT SITUIAT, T4T:-

“(iv) 7 TLRTL, ST TLRTE, T TS &, TATHIT TTIHLT, TCHRTL TTIRHLT AT G A
iii. 7% (), 3T A (i) F we=Tq, Refefa 3o v #ir saentia G s, aum-

“(iii) v TLRTE, TTST TLHRTL, TH ToT &, TATA T TTTERT0T, FEhTr TTTEERr AT FLhT HarT 17;

(2) %" " 53 ¥ 399 Hetaa yiafsat % gearq Ao ww d@emr s sttt v siaenfia
[ERISIUIADEIH

(1) (2) 3) @ |

sgag | o FIU IeATET F FATETSHT H gHT F WAW A & T AT | LT | g
9985 | AT

(3) FH HEAT 54 % qHe, wiaw (3) Fit wRAE F w7 (@), F wearq Ffafea ww @ daentia G
STTUSTT, 72T~

“(T) FS IATET F AATTIHT | AT & ATLAH F < ST ATeAt Hary, |”

(3) FH HEAT 60 F qFe, FHiw (3) i FfAfS & ersx “Faxer w=rrerg,” v At T Sromm, zem:

(8) #H HEAT 65 Y ITY Hateq iateal % earq Mefaied #7 gear i yEarsat & et
[ERIEILUIADEIHE



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 53

(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“65% | o =T w1 ATAFTT srfarfaas, 2005 (2005 #7 22) & siata | LT | g7,
9991 ST T&T O % HTEqH | &1 ST aret aamy
(1) FY EEAT 66 F e, Fiaq (3) F wRATTH -

i, W= (F) % gearq, Metatad 7= v stoenfa G s, gom-

“(Fe) Toreft Srerfores |eerTe 3T 9T 6% & &9 H WAwa & Uas # Ta9r TEaT Fl Ao w1
& ST ATt '

i. 9% (@) .-

(F) IT-TE (iv) §, “ reaiis Fa< qaF” oreal & Aefea Brar s,

@) 3T (iv), F Te=rq, et 3o as v saentia G s, -
“(v) TSR SR AT fRTfeswe & o darse i

(1) UTeqF H, TR, FSF ST qeAT “qiATY (@) F T U oqe%, FTSH AT AT W (W) F 3T
Tz (i), (ii) 3 (i) 7 v gieeariog BT s,

() T o TeAT HEATIrgd Toeqah &0 S eqTad Rt STTuaT, TT:-
“Ferd ofie Y B 77 (@) F 37 \w (v) # [Afgg #rg off s7a UF Seamel o7 96 A8t gnft o i, -
(i) e q& foreT s S==ae Areata Tq¥ aF AT AHFET T % (08T F qreqq q; AT

(iy T sreeT sameattas forar gt % U fRe % w9 § forem % Aveaw & syt
EEL R
(q) FF GEAT 77 F 99, Fiew (3) 7 af=32 &, wg (1) F 97 gAC 9r5al k| T G g "
Y oreal 1 TiaeaTioa fhar Srosm, T9m:-

() %W HEAT 81 % wHer, FHiww (3) N AT F v ww fMwferfea afafe v sfaeerntaa B srom,
7T

“TAeATeTad | TaeT ST % =T H &f ST are(t 94T, -
(F) T, T AT Frue-v=- e qres a1 oo ff e g;

(@) TERTT THIIE, ST q9Trg &Y gfrre gfaetar, |@fa seef= ar w1 der s & qrerar
TS ISt THTE & f9e 2

(3T) |TeET IToT ST TH1UE;

() qTETHE;

STET ST "R (F), (@), (1) AT (F) | TAT F(9Gq AL AT TITHT | T4 F SATTHIL FHT TTdHA
500 9T fq =4t & AfaF T80 17 |

[®T. 5. 354/13/2018 -a°r3m‘{]
= fase, s af=e



54 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Ae: T ATSHEAT F SATAEEAT Ho 12/2017- H [T &7 F (IX), faA1% 28 94, 2017,
ATo Fo o 703 (31), &A= 28 I, 2017 F Tgq LT % TSI, AATLTI, H THITAT
TR I o e =ad sifow a1 sfaR=mT Ho 47/2017- 59 57 &7 #:7(3X), faAiw 14
TqaeT, 2017, |To FTo o 1410 (31) 14 Faa¥, 2017 F T Ferre= BT =m

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 2/2018- Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.76(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 8 of the Union Territory Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017 (14 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public
interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the
notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.12/2017- Union
Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28th June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-
section (i), vide number G.S.R. 703(E), dated the 28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the
words ““ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

@ (@) 3 “ )
“3A Chapter Composite supply of goods and services in which the value Nil Nil”;
99 of supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of

the value of the said composite supply provided to the
Central Government, State Government or Union territory or
local authority or a Governmental authority or a Government
Entity by way of any activity in relation to any function
entrusted to a Panchayat under article 243G of the
Constitution or in relation to any function entrusted to a
Municipality under article 243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three
years” shall be substituted;

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

€)) (©) 3 “) (&)
“19A | Heading Services by way of transportation of | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
9965 goods by an aircraft from customs station number shall apply after the
of clearance in India to a place outside 30" day of September, 2018.
India.
19B Heading Services by way of transportation of | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
9965 goods by a vessel from customs station of number shall apply after the

30" day of September, 2018.”;

clearance in India to a place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be
inserted, namely: -



[ 9T [I-8vE 3(i)] YR T TSI : STHTHROT 55

“(0)

motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of transportation of

students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of pre-school education and

education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

)] (©)) 3 ) 5)
“29A | Heading Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided | Nil Nil”;
9971  or | by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of
Heading | Ccoast Guard under the Group Insurance Schemes of the
9991 Central Government.
(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;
(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -
)] (©)) 3 e 5)
“36A | Heading Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil Nil”;
9971  or | gpecified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991
(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -
0 @ 3) @ 5)
“39A | Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a | Nil Nil”;
9971 multi services SEZ with International Financial Services

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary
of financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed for
regulation of IFSC; or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under
the Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and
Development Authority of India (International Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI) under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

@

against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-

i. in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;



56 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

ii. in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(@v) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

iii. in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53, and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

@) (@) 3) “) &)
“53A | Heading Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural | Nil Nil”;
9985 produce.

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be
inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,”
shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

@) (@) 3) “) &)
“65A | Heading Services by way of providing information under the Right to | Nil Nil”;
9991 Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
i. after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee.”

ii. in item (b),-
(A) in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;
(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

(C) in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letter “sub-items
(1), (i1) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;

(D) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(i) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 57

Note :

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted namely:

“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised
sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)
above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 12/2017 -
Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28thJune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 703 (E), dated the 28t June, 2017
and was last amended by notification No0.47/2017 - Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 14" November, 2017
vide number G.S.R. 1410(E), dated the 140 November, 2017.

i
75 faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

&A1 3/2018- €Y TSTAT T (N)

ALFLRA. 77(.).— T9 5T 7T U qarR afafam, 2017 (2017 F7 14) F =T 7 FF 3741 (3) F I=8d
Sa oTfRRal FT TAN Fd Xy AT, giug & AeErfent ¥ sram uw, naggn, awna avar, Ow geaers (e
faram) & srfag=ET 90 13/2017- €9 Ts7eT #¥ (39), fadi® 28 57, 2017, & av0F10f70 704 (%), fa=i, 28 57,
2017 % Tgd WA & TSI, AT, F 90 ||, gve 3, 37-gve (i) § yariera &rar wam or, o Awfafea siv smr of
YA FAT g, TAqT -

IFq Afer=T H, -

()

el #, w9 TEAT 5 $Y 39q "qataa wfafat & gemq, Metafa w0 d@er siw sug gatea gttt i

s e T STTosm, e

(1) 2 (3) (4)
“5% | ¥ W v Far w7 afyfem, 2017 (2017 # | ¥ex weATE, Tew | FAd WE U fET FY
12) 3 st i Beft =7R% Fr o= wfY Y | WA, w9 awer | FA0TAH, 2017 F A afsd we
FBRTT TT 3T Feg WA, 5T O, 99 e | O AT EEE TSTAT A UH HAT AW
S0 AT ETRT ST 3 T A S AR et | | A afefm, 2017 f amr 21 %
T (vi), ¥ ST oo wrS o
=T=F |
(i)  TIEEI H, IT AT (2.) F LA AT STATET HI Fq AT AT ST, T2T-

‘(=) Tt T srfderat” w1 afem 3@ g S e forw & srfarfRe, 1938 (1938 w1 4) # aRT 2 %
ITETHT (10) ® far mar g
[FT. . 354/13/2018- 'fml'{‘{[]

=t e, s afea



58 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

e : TUTT ATAGAAT AT ATTGAAT Ho 13/2017- HF =& ¥ (3%), fadi® 28 57, 2017, AToFofHo 704 (31),
39T 28 S, 2017 F qgd AT & TSI, STETHTIO, § FHTOT AT ST I/ o7 o7 29§ sitaq a1
Ffe@AT "o 33/2017- F9 AT FT (W), faAT® 13 sFqaw, 2017, AToFofdo 1281 (1) fRATF
13 srqa, 2017 % dga serree o ar =m

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 3/2018- Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.77(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 7 of the Union Territory
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (14 of 2017), the Central Government, on the recommendations of the Council,
hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of
Finance (Department of Revenue), No.13/2017- Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the ZSthune, 2017, published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 704(E), dated the 28%Tune, 2017,
namely:-

In the said notification,-

@) in the Table, after serial number 5 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and the entries
relating thereto shall be inserted, namely: -

ey @3] 3 “

“5A Services supplied by the Central Government, State Government, | Central Any person
Union territory or local authority by way of renting of immovable | Government, registered under the
property to a person registered under the Central Goods and | State Central Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017). Government, Services Tax Act,

Union territory | 2017 read with

or local | clause  (vi)  of

authority section 21 of Union
Territory Goods
and Services Act,
20177;

(ii) in the Explanation, after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -

‘(f) “insurance agent” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (10) of section 2 of the Insurance
Act, 1938 (4 of 1938).".

[F. No. 354/13/2018- TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note : The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 13/2017 -
Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28" June, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 704 (E), dated the 28"June, 2017 and was last
amended by notification No. 33/2017 - Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 13" October, 2017 vide number G.S.R.
1281 (E), dated the 13" October, 2017.

FrfergET
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

H. 04/2018- G TIEGHT X (TT)

qr. M. 78 (F.)— F=0T 9T U FATHRT ATAIH, 2017 (2017 FT 12) FT 4T 148 F AT Gisq €7

TISTET AT UF HaT FT ATAHTH, 2017 (2017 F7 14) Fit 9=T 21 F Tgq Tacd JARAT FT FART Fd gU, Feg TEHIY,
ufrag it Rrrivelt % sream ¥ gt satrat ft fAeatafa ot £ st -




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 59

(F)  TH it =afe o 3 Y Taeme, faeew, fato @t ar s # dsfiaa =af~e v Gl yfawa 5
was |, T AT S, Rt s, fafess ar fAmtor @veer & o fMutor e % w9 § o w
afarw 1 39 §; &7

(@) UH S safh S T e F srfeeTe v & arer & R swfawe & uasr |, qoia: 4T stera: e
F SATErTT o AT % &7 H (et FTraer=d, Fa= 7 [{Aior @v=r & f{ayor i Far ft g 4 &,

FT U UStd Al & €9 § srfegiaa #dl ¢ o araer § Ivdad 3uare (%) § dafdaq Hutor &ar % &9 7 v
THIe T Y IUdad ITATH (@) H gaiia fFEe % qfawm F w7 § yreq giawe uw, IFF qaT A g 9T "6
TISAE T & AT & ST 3T q9T I3T R T I9q Saeru?, faeee, Huior st ot ster S dstispa =af<h, St

fF feurfar 2, v A swrererem, a1 a1 e Autor & % et 2t sifere &1 siawor 39 gt v #war ¢ S i
et staor forere ar ==t wehre & srer Torelt oo (SI9r o aree o) o gwareqe ek siaivd #ear g |

[T. |. 354/13/2018- Zta177]
&= faee, sEe a9t

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 4/2018-Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.78(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 21 of Union Territory Goods and Services Tax Act,
2017 (14 of 2017) read with section 148 of the Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central
Government, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby notifies the following classes of registered persons, namely:-

(a) registered persons who supply development rights to a developer, builder, construction company or any other
registered person against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of construction service of complex,
building or civil structure; and

(b) registered persons who supply construction service of complex, building or civil structure to supplier of
development rights against consideration, wholly or partly, in the form of transfer of development rights,

as the registered persons in whose case the liability to pay Union territory tax on supply of the said services, on the
consideration received in the form of construction service referred to in clause (a) above and in the form of development
rights referred to in clause (b) above, shall arise at the time when the said developer, builder, construction company or any
other registered person, as the case may be, transfers possession or the right in the constructed complex, building or civil
structure, to the person supplying the development rights by entering into a conveyance deed or similar instrument (for
example allotment letter).

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

FrfergET
7% faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

HEqT 5/2018- €9 TSTET FX ()

qr.&.[. 79(3).—F T TSAET WA UF FATRL AfafaEm, 2017 (2017 FT 14) F 4T 8 it IT 4T (1) F
Tgd Tacd AFRIT T TART Fd U, Fwg G, 36 910 F Hqe gId gU % UHT FA7 SHfed § sa9ds g o 7iug
Fr RrTfert F e Y, TAEgmT, Fod U2l ord® AT ITHds T9 AT AT 6 00 JT A9 % (o7 ATHd AT T5T &




60 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

#T S ATAT FATAr i AT T AT 9% T oA T T F IH g7 aF e ol ¢ (o g8 aF Tg Whe o 7
Feg R TR, THA ST A g ORI g U T eqey ® q9r Raffia, F w0 § Feg an B A G
SITH ATl STTAe I SRITET SATaT 2 |

[FT. /. 354/13/2018- E¥am7y]

= faee, s af==

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 5/2018- Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.79(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 8 of the Union Territory Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017 (14 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public
interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby exempts the intra-State supply of services by way of
grant of license or lease to explore or mine petroleum crude or natural gas or both, from so much of the Union territory
tax as is leviable on the consideration paid to the Central Government in the form of Central Government’s share of
profit petroleum as defined in the contract entered into by the Central Government in this behalf.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Digitally signed by
RAKESH RAKESH SUKUL

Date: 2018.01.27 14:56:48
SUKUL <0530

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




		2018-01-27T14:56:48+0530
	RAKESH SUKUL




